CERTIFICATION OF TAX DEED APPLICATION Rule 12D-16.000 oo

Sections 197.502 and 197.542, Florida Statutes Effective 07/18
Page 1 of 2

O725- 8%

Part 1: Tax Deed Application Information

TB INVESTMENT TRUST FBO TERRY BAYLISS
Applicant Name | TB INVESTMENT TRUST FBO TERRY BAYLISS
Applicant Address | 43852 RIVEPOINT DR

LEESBURG, VA 20176

Property CARMANY HOWARD S 1/2 INT

description CARMANY PAULINE 1/2 INT Certificate # 2019 /5587
188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472
CABALLO CT
10-3005-640

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST | Date certificate issued | 06/01/2019
UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1912 P 325
SEC 21/22 T (Full legal attached.)

Part 2: Certificates Owned by Applicant and Filed with Tax Deed Application

Application date Mar 29, 2025

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5: Total
Certificate Number Date of Certificate Sale Face Amount of Certificate Interest (Column 3 + Column 4)
# 2019/5587 06/01/2019 108.06 4539 153.45
# 2020/6017 06/01/2020 92.74 4452 137.26
<>Part 2: Total* 290.71
Part 3: Other Certificates Redeemed by Applicant (Other than County)
Column 2 Column 3 Total
Gerfcate Number |  DateofOtver | Facs Amountof | o GOBnlee, | CRigkg® | (Golumns « Columns
# 2018/5821 06/01/2018 63.30 6.25 77.86 147 41
Part 3: Total* 147.41
Part 4: Tax Collector Certified Amounts (Lines 1-7)
1. Cost of all certificates in applicant's possession and other certificates redeemed by applicant 438.12
(*Total of Parts 2 + 3 above
2. Delinquent taxes paid by the applicant 0.00
3. Current taxes paid by the applicant 0.00
4. Property information report fee 200.00
5. Tax deed application fee 175.00
6. Interest accrued by tax collector under s.197.542, F.S. (see Tax Collector Instructions, page 2) 0.00
7. Total Paid (Lines 1-6) 813.12

| certify the above information is true and the tax certificates, interest, property information report fee, and tax collector's fees
have been paid, and tha?e property information statement is attached.

S

| rd Escambia, Florida
Sign here: Date April_14th, 2025

)ﬁan&T& Coliector or Designee

SeXg this certification to the Clerk of Court by 10 days after the date signed. See Instructions on Page 2




DR-513
Eff. 07/19
Page 2 of 2

Part 5: Clerk of Court Certified Amounts (Lines 8-14)

8. Processing tax deed fee

9. Certified or registered mail charge

10. Clerk of Court advertising, notice for newspaper, and electronic auction fees

11. Recording fee for certificate of notice

12. Sheriff's fees

13. Interest (see Clerk of Court Instructions, page 2)

14.

Total Paid (Lines 8-13)

5. ks

Plus one-half of the assessed value of homestead property, if applicable under s. 197.502(6)(c),

16. Statutory opening bid (tota! of Lines 7, 14, 15, and 16 if applicabie)

Sign here:

Signature, Clerk of Court or Designee

Date of sale 07/02/2025

INSTRUCTIONS

| Tax Collector (compiete Parts 1-4)

Part 2: Certificates Owned by Applicant and Filed with Tax Deed
Application

Enter the Face Amount of Certificate in Column 3 and the Interest in
Column 4 for each certificate number. Add Columns 3 and 4 and enter
the amount in Column 5.

Part 3: Other Certificates Redeemed by Applicant (Other than
County)
Total. Add the amounts in Columns 3, 4 and 5

Part 4: Tax Coliector Certified Amounts (Lines 1-7)
Line 1, enter the total of Part 2 plus the total of Part 3 above.
Total Paid, Line 7: Add the amounts of Lines 1-6

Line 6, Interest accrued by tax collector. Calculate the 1.5 percent
interest accrued from the month after the date of application through the
month this form is certified to the clerk. Enter the amount to be certified
to the clerk on Line 6. The interest calculated by the tax coliector stops
before the interest calculated by the clerk begins. See Section 197.542,
F.S., and Rule 12D-13.060(3), Florida Administrative Code.

4 150

The tax collector's interest for redemption at the time of the tax deed
application is a cost of redemption, which encompasses various
percentages of interest on certificates and omitted or delinquent taxes
under Section 187.502, F.S. This interest is calculated before the tax
collector calculates the interest in Section 197.542, F.S.

Attach certified statement of names and addresses of persons who must
be notified before the sale of the property. Send this form and any
required attachments to the Clerk of Court within 10 days after itis
signed.

I Clerk of Court (complete Part 5) I

Line 13: Interest is calculated at the rate of 1.5 percent per month
starting from the first day of the month after the month of certification of
this form through the last day of the month in which the sale will be held.
Muitiply the calculated rate by the total of Line 7, minus Line 6, plus
Lines 8 through 12. Enter the amount on Line 13.

Line 14: Enter the total of Lines 8-13. Complete Lines 15-18, if
applicable.

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1912 P 325 SEC 21/22 T 3SR

31WSEC 8/12 T 3S R 32W
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APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED o 2
Section 197.502, Florida Statutes

Application Number: 2500019

To: Tax Collector of ESCAMBIA COUNTY , Fiorida

I,

TB INVESTMENT TRUST FBO TERRY BAYLISS
TB INVESTMENT TRUST FBO TERRY BAYLISS
43852 RIVEPOINT DR

LEESBURG, VA 20176,

hold the listed tax certificate and hereby surrender the same to the Tax Coliector and make tax deed application thereon:

Account Number Certificate No. Date Legal Description

10-3005-640 2019/5587 06-01-2019 | LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY
' CLUBESTUNIT7PB8P 90C OR 1885 P

741 OR 1912 P 325 SEC 21/22 T 3S R 31W
SEC 8/12 T 3S R 32W

| agree to:
e pay any current taxes, if due and
+ redeem all outstanding tax certificates plus interest not in my possession, and
e pay all delinquent and omitted taxes, plus interest covering the property.

e pay all Tax Collector’s fees, property information report costs, Clerk of the Court costs, charges and fees, and
Sheriff's costs, if applicable.

Attached is the tax sale certificate on which this application is based and all other certificates of the same legal description
which are in my possession.

Electronic signature on file

TB INVESTMENT TRUST FBO TERRY BAYLISS
TB INVESTMENT TRUST FBO TERRY BAYLISS
43852 RIVEPOINT DR

LEESBURG, VA 20176
03-29-2025
Application Date

Applicant’s signature




Tangible Property Search Sale List

{ Printer Friendly Version |

Gene

Parcel ID:
Account:
Owners:

Mail:

Situs:
Use Code:

Taxing
Authority:

Tax Inquiry:

103005640

CARMANY HOWARD S 1/2 INT
CARMANY PAULINE 1/2 INT

188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472

CABALLO CT 32507
WASTE LAND A

COUNTY MSTU

Open Tax Inquiry Window

ol

Year Land Imprv Total Cap Val

2024 $500 S0 $500 $500

2023 $500 $0 $500 $500

2022 $500 $0 $500 $500
Disclaimer

Tax Estimator

Change of Address

File for Exemption(s) Online

Report Storm Damage

Data

e

Sale Date Book Page
05/1984 1912 325 $100 QC Y

02/1984 1885 741 $4,500 WD Y
03/1981 1520 692 $1,500,000 WD Y
) Reeoore

cal Information

Value Type Mult Parcel Records

G
0
[»

None

Legal i
LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB
8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1912 P 325 SEC 21/22 T3S R

31w Sec... A

active Map

ISection
Map Id:
08-35-32-2

Approx.
Acreage:
0.2419

Zoned: ,O
LDR

Evacuation
& Flood
Information
Qpen
Report




None

The primary use of the assessment data is for the preparation of the current year tax roll. No responsibility or liability is
assumed for inaccuracies or errors.




Pam Childers

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA

INST# 2025026683 4/15/2025 11:57 AM

OFF REC BK: 9302 PG: 1819 Doc Type: TDN

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TB INVESTMENT TRUST holder of Tax Certificate No. 05587, issued
the 1st day of June, A.D., 2019 has filed same in my office and has made application for a tax deed to be issued
thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of Escambia, State of Florida,
to wit:

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1512 P
325 SEC 21/22 T3SR31WSEC 8/12 T3S R 32W
SECTION 08, TOWNSHIP 3 §, RANGE 32 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 103005640 (0725-88)

The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT and PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Wednesday in the month of July, which is the 2nd day

of July 2025.

Dated this 15th day of April 2025.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

PAM CHILDERS
SN CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ksl N, ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
737 = "
L)
‘*&“ﬁﬂ;ﬁr By
Emily Hogg

Deputy Clerk



Precise - Professional - Proven

PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT
3050 Concho Drive, Pensacola, Florida 32507 | Phone: 850-466-3077

THE ATTACHED REPORT IS ISSUED TO:
SCOTT LUNSFORD, ESCAMBIA COUNTY TAX COLLECTOR

TAX ACCOUNT #: 10-3005-640 CERTIFICATE #: 2019-5587

THIS REPORT IS NOT TITLE INSURANCE. THE LIABILITY FOR ERRORS OR OMISSIONS IN THIS
REPORT IS LIMITED TO THE PERSON(S) EXPRESSLY IDENTIFIED BY NAME IN THE PROPERTY
INFORMATION REPORT AS THE RECIPIENT(S) OF THE PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT.

The attached Report prepared in accordance with the instructions given by the user named above includes a
listing of the owner(s) of record of the land described herein together with current and delinquent ad valorem
tax information and a listing and copies of all open or unsatisfied leases, mortgages, judgments and
encumbrances recorded in the Official Record Books of Escambia County, Florida that encumber the title to
said land as listed on page 2 herein.

This Report is subject to: Current year taxes; taxes and assessments due now or in subsequent years; oil, gas,
and mineral or any subsurface rights of any kind or nature; easements, restrictions and covenants of record;
encroachments, overlaps, boundary line disputes.

This Report does not insure or guarantee the validity or sufficiency of any document attached, nor is it to be
considered a title insurance policy, an opinion of title, a guarantee of title, or as any other form of guarantee or
warranty of title.

Use of the term “Report™ herein refers to the Property Information Report and the documents attached hereto.

Period Searched: April 11, 2005 to and including April 11, 2025 Abstractor: Andrew Hunt

BY

ot/

Michael A. Campbell,
As President
Dated: April 21, 2025



PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT
CONTINUATION PAGE
April 21, 2025
Tax Account #: 10-3005-640

1. The Grantee(s) of the last deed(s) of record is/are: HOWARD S CARMANY AND PAULINE
CARMANY

By Virtue of Quit Claim Deed recorded 5/17/1984 in OR 1912/325 together with Warranty Deed
recorded 3/16/1984 in OR 1885/741

2. The land covered by this Report is: See Attached Exhibit “A”

3. The following unsatisfied mortgages, liens, and judgments affecting the land covered by this Report
appear of record:

a. NONE
4. Taxes:

Taxes for the year(s) 2017-2024 are delinquent.
Tax Account #: 10-3005-640

Assessed Value: $500.00

Exemptions: NONE

5. We find the following HOA names in our search (if a condominium, the condo docs book and page are
included for your review): PERDIDO BAY COUNTY CLUB ESTATES HOMEOWNER'S
ASSOCIATION INC

Payment of any special liens/assessments imposed by City, County, and/or State.

Note: Escambia County and/or local municipalities may impose special liens/assessments. These
liens/assessments are not discovered in a Property Information Report or shown above. These special
assessments typically create a lien on real property. The entity that governs subject property must be contacted
to verify payment status.



PERDIDO TITLE SOLUTIONS

PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT
3050 Concho Drive, Pensacola, Florida 32507 | Phone 850-466-3077

Scott Lunsford

Escambia County Tax Collector
P.O. Box 1312

Pensacola, FL 32591

CERTIFICATION: PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT FOR TDA

TAX DEED SALE DATE: JUL 2, 2025
TAX ACCOUNT #: 10-3005-640
CERTIFICATE #: 2019-5587

In compliance with Section 197.522, Florida Statutes, the following is a list of names and addresses of
those persons, firms, and/or agencies having legal interest in or claim against the above-described
property. The above-referenced tax sale certificate is being submitted as proper notification of tax deed
sale.

YES NO

] X] Notify City of Pensacola, P.O. Box 12910, 32521

[] X Notify Escambia County, 190 Governmental Center, 32502
[] XI Homestead for 2024 tax year.

HOWARD S CARMANY AND HOWARD S CARMANY AND

PAULINE CARMANY PAULINE CARMANY

18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244 188 HARRELL RD

DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230 RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472

LESLIE JOHNSON LESLIE JOHNSON

PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB ESTATES PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB ESTATES
HOMEOWNER’S ASSOCIATION INC HOMEOWNER’S ASSOCIATION INC

PO BOX 16231 5194 PALE MOON DR

PENSACOLA, FL 32507 PENSACOLA, FL 32507

Certified and delivered to Escambia County Tax Collector, this 21* day of April 2025.

PERDIDO TITLE & ABSTRACT, INC.

ot

BY: Michael A. Campbell, As Its President

NOTE: The above-mentioned addresses are based upon current information available, but addresses are not
guaranteed to be true or correct.



PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT
April 21, 2025
Tax Account #:10-3005-640

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
EXHIBIT "A"

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1912 P
325 SEC 21/22 T 3SR 31W SEC 8/12 T 3S R 32W

SECTION 08, TOWNSHIP 3 S, RANGE 32 W

TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 10-3005-640(0725-88)
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AT

Made this day of Fi r i , 19 , between O UTARLE BAMK,
H.A., & fiatLonal Ganking ansoclation, hereinafter enlled woranbor " and
Howard §. Cacmony

¥

hereinarter cakird Thrantes,” WD maTiing #adress 13
18592 Wescview Park #2644, foviestown, OH 44230

-

WITHESSETH:

that Cranter for VALURBLE JONSIDERATION, the racelpt whercol iz hereby
aclmowiedged, has granted, pargained, and sold to Grantees, his, ner, its, or therr
neirs, SUCCesSSOrS, and assigns forever, the following described land in the County of
Escampia, State of Florida, to-wib:

tot{s) _ 56 . Block i1 , in PERDIDOG BAY %@N‘SM
crys ESTAIES, UHET , A% Froorded in Plat Book 5

7
Page gg} , of the Publie Records of Escamblia Connty, viarida.

Thiz desd IS executed and such sale Is subject O conditions, covenants,
restrictions, reservations, easements, zoning, and other matbters of record; bLaxes,
leviegs, and assessments for the calendar year for which this deed is executed; 211
matters shown on the above-referenced plat or Wirteh would be disclesed by an acourate
survey or personal tnspeation of the property; and & 1ien on the properiy in ravor of
Crantor or developsr for the particular facility and its suscessors and assignd, for
Grantes's share af the cost of strest  construction, grsinage, SeWerage, water
facitivies, and related englneerieg cost and other factlities, in this area imowm as
perdido Bay Country iuh Eskates wnen and as such cosly are assessed to Orantee,
provided thab Grantor heresby subordinates such lien vs the Lien of any Fipst porigade
on the property in favar of any bank, sSavings and loan asscclatien, insurance
company, or other ipstitutional lender. prantor nereby warrants the title to sald
land (except for eitle matters existiog on and prior to December 31, 1976} and will
defend the same against the lawful elaims of all persons WHOMSOBVEr, except a3
aforesaid. Provided, mowever, that Grantor expressly reserves s ipself and its
suecessors and assigns an easement over, under, and through all of the land herein
conveyed for the purpase of insballing, econstrusting, repaliring, and maintaining
roads, drainage facilities, and utilitvies of all wxinds and deseription unitil December
31, 2007.

1K WITHESZS WHEREOF, Crantor has caused these presents to be signed in its name
by its authorized of ficer and 1ts corporate sesl to be affixed the day and ycar first
ghove written.

2 7 ? G : EQUITABLE BANK, Hobhoy B
sational Banking Association

Ry: H o~ i* A 5‘;[ Y e
President }

&

1 HEREBY CERTIFY, that on this. é/’fﬁ; day of Méf“:g- ol bbed v 19 54, vefore
me ,persanall}; appeared 4 T Sk 2. _as gﬁa prasident and
S N 7.l @8 the secretary Eqnitople Bank, N.A., 3 Mational
Tnking  asscciallon, Tome nown to e the persons wWhe signed the foregolng
tnstrument as such officers, and they acimowledged the execution thereof to be their
free act and deed as such officers for the uses and purposes therein mentioned, that
they gffixed thereLo the seal of sand association, and that the gaid jnstrument is
she act and deed of said sssociation.

S pasig sir%mss my signature and official sesl in the County of 4 é:.;.w“}ff“,;« .. State of

ZZ:«*’”{; jr_/:gf»m"\f:-\, the day and year last afaresaid. o
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twres exevulors sdmnistrators and asauges. Biever the following descotbed propecey situnted
Lot

her

s R T

inthe Connty of __EscambIa .. Statesl _ Florida

Lot 86. Bleck 11, lu Pordido Bav Comty ©lub Feearss, thic 7,
as receotded in Plat Beok 8,

Bzearbia County, Florida.

nage 9% £, of the Public Records of

Selnp an podivided one half dnterese fo the above described prewmises.

Together with all and shugular the tenenments, feediterents zud appucdenances thertn belonprng o in
aywise pppertamung free from all exemptons sad dght of homestead.
INWENESS WHEREDF, . Lo have Boceuntoses v hond _sedsenf this 2

dayof 2y An e B4

ASEALY
1BeaLd

Thez instrument was prepared by
&nthony B Auten, Attorney

10 F_ tain St Ashlane, OH 66805
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STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

I, PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY,
FLORIDA, do hereby certify that I did on May 15, 2025, mail a copy of the foregoing Notice of

CERTIFICATE OF NOTICE OF MAILING
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

Application for Tax Deed, addressed to:

HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT
188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472

PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT
188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472

CERTIFICATE # 05587 of 2019

HOWARD S CARMANY

18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244
DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230

PAULINE CARMANY
18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244
DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230

PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB ESTATES HOMEOWNER'S ASSOCIATION INC
PO BOX 16231
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

LESLIE JOHNSON
PO BOX 16231
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB ESTATES HOMEOWNER'S ASSOCIATION INC
5194 PALE MOON DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

LESLIE JOHNSON
5194 PALE MOON DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

WITNESS my official seal this 15th day of May 2025.

h‘ U, b&w *q\:*":‘

B T

PAM CHILDERS

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk




WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE A
LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON July 2, 2025,
UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT
THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TB INVESTMENT TRUST holder of Tax Certificate No. 05587, issued
the 1st day of June, A.D., 2019 has filed same in my office and has made application for a tax deed to be issued
thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of Escambia, State of Florida,
to wit:

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1912 P
325SEC 21/22 T3S R31W SEC 8/12 T3S R 32W

SECTION 08, TOWNSHIP 3 S, RANGE 32 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 103005640 (0725-88)

The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT and PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Wednesday in the month of July, which is the 2nd day
of July 2025.

Dated this 16th day of May 2025.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk

IF THE PROPERTY PROCEEDS TO SALE, YOU WILL RECEIVE NOTICE
FROM US REGARDING SURPLUS FUNDS. YOU MAY CLAIM THE FUNDS
DIRECTLY FROM OUR OFFICE, FREE OF CHARGE. PAYING A FEE FROM
THE SURPLUS FOR ASSISTANCE FROM A THIRD PARTY IS NOT
REQUIRED.
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HOWARD S CARMANY 12 INT
[0725-88]
188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 2947,

-

9171°9690.0935 0127 1884 97
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HOWARD s CARMANY [0725-88]
18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244
DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230

9171 9690 0935 0127 1884 59
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PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB
ESTATES HOMEOWNER'S
ASSOCIATION INC [0725-88]
PO BOX 16231
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

91719690 09350127 188435

PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB
ESTATES HOMEOWNER'S
ASSOCIATION INC [0725-88]
5194 PALE MOON DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

91719690 0935 0127 1884 11

UWSEAOWN " S5

PAULINE CARMANY 12 INT [0725-88]
188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, sc 29472
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LESLIE JOHNSON [0725-88]
PO BOX 16231
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

9171 9690 0935 0127 188428

LESLIE JOHNSON [0725-88]
5194 PALE MOON DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

—- 91719690 0935 0127 1884 04



Pam Childers
Clerk of the Circuit Court & Comptroller
Official Records
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HOWARD S CARMANY
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PAULINE CARMANY [0725-88]
18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244
DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230
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Pam Childers |
Clerk of the Circuit Court & Comptroller
oOfficial Recors
e, Stite 110

HOWARD S CARMANY 172 INT
[0725-88]
188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472
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PUBLISHED WEEKLY SINCE 1948
(Warrington) Pensacola, Escambia County, Florida

STATE OF FLORIDA

County of Escambia

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared Michael P. Driver
who is personally known to me and who on oath says that he is
Publisher of The Escambia Sun Press, a weekly newspaper
published at (Warrington) Pensacola in Escambia County,

Florida; that the attached copy of advertisement, being a
NOTICE in the matter of TAX DEED SALE

SALE DATE — 07-02-2025 — TAX CERTIFICATE #’S 05587
CIRCUIT

in the Court
was published in said newspaper in the issues of

MAY 29 & JUNE 5, 12, 19, 2025

Affiant further says that the said Escambia Sun-Press is a
newspaper published at (Warrington) Pensacola, in said
Escambia County, Florida, and that the said newspaper has
heretofore been continuously published in said Escambia County,
Florida each week and has been entered as second class mail
matter at the post office in Pensacola, in said Escambia and Santa Rosa
Counties, Florida, for a period of one year next preceding the first
publication of the attached copy of advertisement; and affiant
further says that he has neither paid nor promised any person,
firm or corporation any discount, rebate, commission or refund
for the purpose of securing this advertisement for publication
in the said newspaper. Affiant complies with all legal requirements for pub-
lication in chapter 50, Florida Statutes.

4w,

Digitally signed by Michael P Driver

DN: ¢=US, o=The Escambia Sun Press LLC,
dnQualifier=A01410D0000019093B5D40A000E97D9, cn=Michael P Driver
Date: 2025.06.19 11:25:52 -05'00"

PUBLISHER

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 19TH day of  JUNE
A.D., 2025

Digitally signed by Heather Tuttle

DN: c=US, 0=The Escambia Sun Press LLC,
dnQualifier=A01410C000001890CD5793600064AAE, cn=Heather Tuttle
Date: 2025.06.19 11:28:31 -05'00"

Fnthe Hettte

HEATHER TUTTLE
NOTARY PUBLIC RO
e Notary Public, State of Florida
o) #si My Comm. Expires June 24, 2028

Commission No. HH 535214
Page 1 of 1

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR
TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TB
INVESTMENT TRUST holder of Tax Cer-
tificate No. 05587, issued the 1st day of
June, A.D., 2019 has filed same in my of-
fice and has made application for a tax deed
to be issued thereon. Said certificate em-
braces the following described property in
the County of Escambia, State of Florida,
to wit:

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUN-
TRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR
1885 P 741 OR 1912 P 325 SEC 21/22 T
3S R 31W SEC 8/12 T 3S R 32W SEC-
TION 08, TOWNSHIP 3 S, RANGE 32 W

TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 103005640
(0725-88)

The assessment of the said property under
the said certificate issued was in the name
of HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT and
PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed
according to law, the property described
therein will be sold to the highest bidder at
public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first
Wednesday in the month of July, which is
the 2nd day of July 2025.

Dated this 22nd day of May 2025.

In accordance with the AMERICANS
WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a
person with a disability who needs special
accommodation in order to participate in
this proceeding you are entitled to the pro-
vision of certain assistance. Please contact
Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior
to the proceeding at Escambia County Gov-
ernment Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste
110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

PAM CHILDERS

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
(SEAL)

By: Emily Hogg

Deputy Clerk

oaw-4w-05-29-06-05-12-19-2025
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Scott Lunsford, CFC - Escambia County Tax Collétor [OFE

EscambiaTaxCollector.com ﬂ facebook.com/ECTaxCollector y twitter.com/escambiatc

2024 REAL ESTATE TAXES

Notice of Ad Valorem and Non-Ad Valorem Assessments SCAN TO PAY ONLINE

ACCOUNT NUMBER MILLAGE CODE ESCROW CODE PROPERTY REFERENCE NUMBER
10-3005-640 06 083$326000086011
PROPERTY ADDRESS: EXEMPTIONS:
CARMANY HOWARD S 1/2 INT CABALLO CT
CARMANY PAULINE 1/2 INT
188 HARRELL RD PRIOR YEAR(S) TAXES OUTSTANDING

RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472

AD VALOREM TAXES

COUNTY 6.6165 500 500 3.31
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BY LOCAL BOARD 1.7520 500 0 500 0.88

BY STATE LAW 3.0950 500 0 500 1.55
WATER MANAGEMENT 0.0218 500 0 500 0.01
SHERIFF 0.6850 500 0 500 0.34
M.S.T.U. LIBRARY 0.3590 500 0 500 0.18
ESCAMBIA CHILDRENS TRUST 0.4043 500 0 500 0.20

TOTAL MILLAGE  12.9336 AD VALOREM TAXES $6.47
LEGAL DESCRIPTION NON-AD VALOREM ASSESS

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST
UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 19
See Additional Legal on Tax Roll

NON-AD VALOREM ASSESSMENTS $0.00

Pay online at EscambiaTaxCollector.com

Payments must be in U.S. funds drawn from a US. bank

If Paid By Jun 30, 2025
Please Pay $0.00

COMBINED TAXES AND ASSESSMENTS $6.47

RETAIN FOR YOUR RECORDS

2024 REAL ESTATE TAXES DETACH HERE AND RETURN THIS PORTION WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Make checks payable to: Payments in U.S. funds from a U.S. bank
Scott Lunsford, CFC PAY ONLY ONE AMOUNT
Escambia County Tax Collector
ACCOUNT NUMBER PO. BOX 1312 AMOUNTIF PAIDBY U™ ¢3)°602°25
10-3005-640 PENSACOLA, FL 32591 -
PROPERTY ADDRESS Pay online at EscambiaTaxCollector.com AMOUNT IF PAID BY
CABALLOCT
AMOUNT IF PAID BY
PRIOR YEAR(S) TAXES
CARMANY HOWARD S 1/2 INT OUTSTANDING AMOUNT IF PAID BY
CARMANY PAULINE 1/2 INT

188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472

AMOUNT IF PAID BY

DO NOT FOLD, STAPLE, OR MUTILATE



Mxlinda Johnson (S_Q_C)

L B
From: Terry Bayliss <tdbayliss13@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, July 5, 2025 8:06 AM
To: Mylinda Johnson (COC)
Subject: [EXTERNAL]JRe: TAX DEED SALE 7/2/2025 - NO BID PROPERTIES

gyou recognize thesenderand know the content is safe.

‘WARNING! This email originated from an outside network. DO NOT CLICK links or attachments unless

Mylinda, Thank you for reaching out. Yes we would like to take title to the properties.

Terry Bayliss
Maria Bayliss

On Thu, Jul 3, 2025 at 12:53 PM Mylinda Johnson (COC) <MJOHNSON®@escambiaclerk.com> wrote:

Good morning,

You are the certificate holder for the properties listed below. These properties were scheduled for auction on
7/2/2025 and the

auction resulted with “no bids”.

Please let us know if you would like to take title to the property. We have the title information listed as follows:

Certificate 2019 TD 05537 (083S321301001010)
MB INVESTMENT TRUST, 43852 RIVERPOINT DR, LEESBURG VA 20176

$43.10 refund is due to you

Certificate 2019 TD 05538 (083S321301002010)

MB INVESTMENT TRUST, 43852 RIVERPOINT DR, LEESBURG VA 20176

$43.10 refund is due to you




Certificate 2019 TD 05539 (0835321301003010)
MB INVESTMENT TRUST, 43852 RIVERPOINT DR, LEESBURG VA 20176

$43.10 refund is due to you

Certificate 2019 TD 05587 (CABALLO CT 32507)
TB INVESTMENT TRUST, 43852 RIVERPOINT DR, LEESBURG VA 20176

$1.40 refund is due to you

Thanks,

Mylinda

Mpylinda Johnson

Operations Supervisor

850-595-4813

mjohnson@escambiaclerk.com

Office of Pam Childers

Escambia County Clerk of the Circuit
Court & Comptroller

221 S. Palafox Street, Suite 110, Pensacola, F1. 32502

www.EscambiaClerk.com




Under Florida law, written communication to or from the Escambia County Clerk’s Office

may be subject to public records disclosure.



PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT
CIRCUIT CIVIL
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL
COUNTY CIVIL
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW
JURY ASSEMBLY
JUVENILE
MENTAL HEALTH
MIS
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE
TRAFFIC

PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
No Bid Tax Deed Sale

Cert # 005587 of 2019 Date 7/2/2025
Name NO BID

Escambia County Government Complex * 221 Palafox Place Ste 110  PENSACS

COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA
OFFICE OF THE

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

BRANCH OFFICES
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
JUVENILE DIVISION
CENTURY

CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OFFICIAL RECORDS
COUNTY TREASURY
AUDITOR

Cash Summary

Cash Deposit ~ $0.00

Total Check $118.60

Grand Total $118.60

PAM CHILDERS

Clerk of the £

JORIDA 32502

(850) 595-3793 « FAX (850) 595-4827 « http://www.clerk.co.escambia.fl.us

CeepiT S 15D
'm::}x@ < Do’

gu—




. Sold To Rl Redeem E] Forms 3 Courtview ﬁ Benchmark

% search Property %& Property Sheet (3] Lien Holder's [
Fee Due Clerk Lien Holders

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Tax Deed Sales - Sold To
Postage $65.60

Account: 103005640 Certificate Number: 005587 of 2019

Date Of Sale  [7/2/2025 38|

$200 or 5% Deposit [1 Advance Recording Deed 1$10.00 I

Sold Amount [$1,423.37 ]

Postage $65.60 | Adv Recording Mail Cert 1$18.50 I

High Bidder O Certficate Holder No Bid @  Certficate Holder High Bid O

NO BID
Bidder's Name

TB INVESTMENT TRUST
Grantee's Name

43852 RIVERPOINT DR

Grantee's LEESBURG VA 20176

Address

Notes

O[22 >




PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT
CIRCUIT CIVIL
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL
COUNTY CIVIL
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW
JURY ASSEMBLY
JUVENILE
MENTAL HEALTH
MIS
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE
TRAFFIC

PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
No Bid Tax Deed Sale

Cert # 005587 of 2019 Date 7/2/2025
Name NO BID

BRANCH OFFICES
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
JUVENILE DIVISION
CENTURY

CLERK TO THE BOARD OF

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OFFICIAL RECORDS
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
Cash Summary
Cash Deposit ~ $0.00
Total Check  $118.60
Grand Total  $118.60

Purchase Price $1,423.37 Opening Bid Amount $1,423.37 OverBid Amount $0.00

Sheriff Services over $60
Legal Ad over $165

Total Check
Adv Recording Deed
Adv Doc. Stamps

Postage

Researcher Copies

$118.60
$10.00
$10.50
$65.60
$0.00

Adv Recording Mail Cert $18.50

Clerk's Prep Fee

$14.00

Total Extra TD Registry of Court Fees 0

PAM CHILDERS
Clerk of the Circuit Court

By:

Deputy Clerk

Escambia County Government Complex * 221 Palafox Place Ste 110 PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
(850) 595-3793 « FAX (850) 595-4827 ¢ http://www.clerk.co.escambia.fl.us



PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUIT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF

JURY ASSEMBLY i COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE OFFICIAL RECORDS

MENTAPI:IIEEALTH COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY

OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC
Case # 2019 TD 005587
Sold Date 7/2/2025
Name NO BID
RegistryOfCourtT = TAXDEED 0
overbidamount = TAXDEED $0.00
PostageT = TD2 $65.60
Researcher Copies = TD6 $0.00
prepFee = TD4 $14.00
advdocstampsdeed = TAXDEED $10.50
advancerecording = TAXDEED $18.50
AdvRecordingDeedT = TAXDEED $10.00
Date Docket Desc M VIEW IMAGES

6/1/2019 0101 CASE FILED 06/0%/;(())%)% 5C;75E NUMBER 2019
4/15/2025 RECEIPT PAYMENT $456.00 RECEIPT #2025028598
4/15/2025 TD83 TAX COLLECTOR CERTIFICATION
4/15/2025 TD84 PA'S INFO
4/15/2025 TD84 NOTICE OF TDA
4/22/2025 TD82 PROPERTY INFORMATION REPORT
5/27/2025 TD81 CERTIFICATE OF MAILING
6/18/2025 TD84 CERTIFIED MAIL TRACKING / ADDITIONAL

RESEARCH / RETURNED MAIL

CHECK (CHECKID 143312) VOIDED: ESCAMBIA
6/20/2025 CheckVoided SUN PRESS 605 S OLD CORRY FIELD RD
PENSACOLA, FL 32507

CHECK PRINTED: CHECK # 900039041 --

6/20/2025 CheckMailed TRy CHeCK
6/24/2025 TD84 PROOF OF PUBLICATION
6/30/2025 TD84 2024 TAX BILL
FEES
EffectiveDate FeeCode FeeDesc TotalFee AmountPaid WaivedAmount AmountQOutstanding
4/15/2025 Z:37:21 - pecoro? RECORD FEE FIRST PAGE 10.00 10.00 0.00 0.00
4/15/2025 2:37:22 1axpEED TAX DEED CERTIFICATES 320.00 320.00 0.00 0.00
4115/ 2°§f42:37:21 D1 TAX DEED APPLICATION 60.00 60.00 0.00 0.00
415/ 20%;2:37:21 TD4 PREPARE ANY INSTRUMENT 7.00 7.00 0.00 0.00
415/ 20,2,;2‘37’22 TD7 ONLINE AUCTION FEE 59.00 59.00 0.00 0.00
Total 456.00 456.00 0.00 0.00

RECEIPTS
ReceiptDate  ReceiptNumber Received_from payment_amt applied_amt refunded_amt



4/15/2025 2:38:49 PM 2025028598 TB INVESTMENT TRUST 456.00 456.00 0.00

Total 456.00 456.00 0.00
REGISTRY
CashierDate Type TransactionID TransactionName Name Amount Status
6/20/2025 9:19:07 AM Check (outgoing) 102010442 ESCAMBIA SUN PRESS 605 S OLD CORRY FIELD RD ~ 200.00 900039041 CLEARED ON 6/20/2025
4/15/2025 2:38:49PM  Deposit 101989608 TB INVESTMENT TRUST 320.00 Deposit
Deposited Used Balance

320.00 8,400.00 -8,080.00



Pam Childers

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
STATE OF FLORIDA ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA INST# 2025052735 7/14/2025 3:46 PM

OFF REC BK: 9347 PG: 1379 Doc Type: COM
Recording $18.50

CERTIFICATE OF NOTICE OF MAILING
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

CERTIFICATE # 05587 of 2019
I, PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY,

FLORIDA, do hereby certify that I did on May 15, 2025, mail a copy of the foregoing Notice of
Application for Tax Deed, addressed to:

HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT

PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT

188 HARRELL RD 188 HARRELL RD
RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472 RIDGEVILLE, SC 29472
HOWARD S CARMANY PAULINE CARMANY

18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244 | 18592 WESTVIEW PARK 4244
DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230 DOYLESTOWN, OH 44230

PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB ESTATES HOMEOWNER'S ASSOCTATION INC | LESLIE JOHNSON
PO BOX 16231 PO BOX 16231
PENSACOLA, FL 32507 PENSACOLA, FL 32507

PERDIDO BAY COUNRTY CLUB ESTATES HOMEQWNER'S ASSOCIATION INC| LESLIE JOHNSON
5194 PALE MOON DR 5194 PALE MOON DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32507 PENSACOLA, FL 32507

WITNESS my official seal this 15th day of May 2025.

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk




Sun Press

PUBLISHED WEEKLY SINCE 1948
(Warrington) Pensacola, Escambia County, Florida

STATE OF FLORIDA

County of Escambia

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared Michael P. Driver
who is personally known to me and who on oath says that he is

Publisher of The Escambia Sun Press, a weekly newspaper
published at (Warrington) Pensacola in Escambia County,

Florida; that the attached copy of advertisement, being a
NOTICE in the matter of TAX DEED SALE

SALE DATE - 07-02-2025 — TAX CERTIFICATE #’S 05587
in the CIRCUIT
was published in said newspaper in the issues of
MAY 29 & JUNE §, 12, 19, 2025

Court

Affiant further says that the said Escambia Sun-Press is a
newspaper published at (Warrington) Pensacola, in said
Escambia County, Florida, and that the said newspaper has
heretofore been continuously published in said Escambia County,
Florida each week and has been entered as second class mail
matter at the post office in Pensacola, in said Escambia and Santa Rosa
Counties, Florida, for a period of one year next preceding the first
publication of the attached copy of advertisement; and affiant
further says that he has neither paid nor promised any person,
firm or corporation any discount, rebate, commission or refund
for the purpose of securing this advertisement for publication
in the said newspaper. Affiant complies with all legal requirements for pub-
lication in chapter 50, Florida Statutes.

Wi

Digitaly signed by Michaal P Driver

DN: ¢=US, 0=The Escambia Sun Press LLC,
dnQualifier=A01410D0000018093B5D40A000E97D9, cn=Michas| P Oriver
Daie: 2025.06.19 11:25:52 -05'00

PUBLISHER

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 19TH day of  JUNE
A.D., 2025

Digitally signed by Heather Tuttle

DN: c=U$, 0=The Escambia Sun Press LLC,
dnQualifier=AG1410C0C0001830CD5793600064AAE, cn=Heather Tuttle
Date: 2025.06.19 11:28:31 -0500

Fntbe, Htte

HEATHER TUTTLE
NOTARY PUBLIC

HEATHER TUTTLE
Notary Public, State of Florida
My Comm, Expires June 24, 2028
Commission No, HH 535214

Page 1 of 1

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR
TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TB
INVESTMENT TRUST holder of Tax Cer-
tificate No. 05587, issued the lst day of
June, A.D., 2019 has filed same in my of-
fice and has made application for a tax deed
to be issued thereon. Said certificate em-
braces the following described property in
the County of Escambia, State of Florida,
to wit:

LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUN-
TRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR
1885 P 741 OR 1912 P 325 SEC 21/22 T
38 R 31W SEC 8/12 T 38 R 32W SEC-
TION 08, TOWNSHIP 3 S, RANGE 32 W

TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 103005640
(0725-88)

The assessment of the said property under
the said certificate issued was in the name
of HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT and
PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed
according to law, the property described
therein will be sold to the highest bidder at
public auction at 9:00 A M. on the first
Wednesday in the month of July, which is
the 2nd day of July 2025.

Dated this 22nd day of May 2025.

In accordance with the AMERICANS
WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a
person with a disability who needs special
accommodation in order to participate in
this proceeding you are entitled to the pro-
vision of certain assistance. Please contact
Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior
to the proceeding at Escambia County Gov-
ernment Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste
110, Pensacola FL 32502, Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

PAM CHILDERS

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
(SEAL)

By: Emily Hogg

Deputy Clerk
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Escambia County, Florida

for official use only

Tax Certificate numbered 05587 issued on June 1, 2019 was filed in the office of the tax collector of Escambia County, Florida. An application has been made
for the issuance of a tax deed. The applicant has paid or redeemed all other taxes or tax certificates on the land as required by law. The notice of sale, including the
cost and expenses of this sale, has been published as required by law. No person entitled to do so has appeared to redeem the land. On the 2nd day of July 2025, the
land was offered for sale. It was sold to TB INVESTMENT TRUST, 43852 RIVERPOINT DR LEESBURG VA 20176, who was the highest bidder and has paid the
sum of the bid as required by law.

The lands described below, including any inherited property, buildings, fixtures, and improvements of any kind and description, situated in this County and State.

Description of lands: LOT 86 BLK 11 PERDIDO BAY COUNTRY CLUB EST UNIT 7 PB 8 P 90C OR 1885 P 741 OR 1912 P 325 SEC
21722 T3SR31W SEC 8/12 T 3S R 32W SECTION 08, TOWNSHIP 3 S, RANGE 32 W

** Property previously assessed to: HOWARD S CARMANY 1/2 INT, PAULINE CARMANY 1/2 INT

On 2nd day of July 2025, in Escambia County, Florida, for the sum of ( $1,423.37) ONE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED TWENTY THREE

AND 37/100 Dollars, the,gmount paid asxequired by law. <
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Pam Childers,
Clerk of Court and Comptroller
Escambia County, Florida

- -
pa——

Pensacola, FL 32502

On this w day of w\"{ 20 , before me personally appeared % Dl'\\ km&

Clerk of Court and Comptroller in and for the State and thisdunty known to me to be the person described in, and who executed the foregoing instrument, and
acknowledged the execution of this instrument to be his own free act and deed for the use and purposes therein mentioned.

Witness my hand and office seal date aforesaid

Mylinda Johnson
Comm.: HH 622730
Expires: Jan. 2, 2028




