FORM 512 NOTICE TO TAX COLLECTOR OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED Application Number
1700026

TO: Tax Collector of ESCAMBIA COUNTY : SCOTT LUNSFORD

In accordance with the Florida Statutes, |, TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15
PO BOX 54876
NEW ORLEANS, LA 70154

. holder of the following tax sale certificate hereby surrender same to the Tax Collector and make tax deed application
thereon:

Certificate No. Date Legal Description

2014/ 2813 06-01-2014 LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287

| agree to pay all delinquent taxes, redeem all outstanding tax certificates not in my possession, pay any omitted
taxes, and pay current taxes, if due, covering the land, and pay any interest earned (a) on tax certificates not in my
possession, (b) on omitted taxes or (c) on delinquent taxes. | also agree to pay all tax collector's fees, ownership and
encumbrance report costs, clerk of the court costs, charges and fees and sheriff's costs, if applicable. Attached is the
above- mentioned tax sale certificate on which this application is based and all other certificates of the same legal

description which are in my possession.

Electronic signature on file 01-23-2017
Applicant's Signature Date




I7-19y

Tax Collector’s Certification CTY-513

Tax Deed Application Number Date of Tax Deed Application

1700026

Jan 23, 2017

This is to certify that TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15, holder of Tax Sale Certificate Number 2014 / 2813, Issued the 1st
Day of June, 2014 and which encumbers the following described property in the county of Escambia County, State of Florida, to wit:

05-5687-000

Cert Holder:

TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15
PO BOX 54876NEW ORLEANS, LA 70154

Property Owner:
ALLEN ESTELLA

10401 CEDAR CREEK DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32506
LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287
has surrendered same in my office and made written application for tax deed in accordance with Florida Statutes. I certify that the
following tax certificates, interest, ownership and encumbrance report fee, and Tax Collector's fees have been paid, or if the

certificate is held by the County, all appropriate fees have been deposited.

Certificates owned by applicant and filed in connection with this application:

Account Face Amount
Certificate Year/Number Number Sale Date of Certificate Interest Total
2014/2813 05-5687-000 06/01/2014 603.04 36.18 639.22
Certificates redeemed by applicant or included {County) in connection with this tax deed application:
Account Face Amount Tax Collector’'s
Certificate Year/Number Number Sale Date of Certificate Fee Interest Total
2016/2707 05-5687-000 06/01/2016 153.01 6.25 18.36 177.62
2015/2993 05-5687-000 06/01/2015 140.42 6.25 42.13 188.80

Amounts Certified by Tax Collector (Lines 1-7): Total Amount Paid

1. Tota! of all Certificates in Applicant's Possession and Cost of the Certificates Redeemed by Applicant 1,005.64
2. Total of Delinquent Taxes Paid by Tax Deed Applicant 0.00

3. Total of Current Taxes Paid by Tax Deed Applicant 391.60
4. Ownership and Encumbrance Report Fee 200.00
5. Tax Deed Application Fee 175.00
6. Total Interest Accrued by Tax Collector Pursuant to Section 197.542, F.S.

7. Total (Lines 1 - 6) 1,772.24

Amounts Certified by Clerk of Court (Lines 8-15): Total Amount Paid

8. Clerk of Court Statutory Fee for Processing Tax Deed

9. Clerk of Court Certified Mail Charge

10. Clerk of Court Advertising Charge

11. Clerk of Court Recording Fee for Certificate of Notice

12, Sheriff's Fee

13, Interest Computed by Clerk of Court Pursuant to Section 197.542, F.S.
14. Total (Lines 8 - 13)

15. One-half Assessed Value of Homestead Property, if Applicable per F.S.
16. Other Outstanding Certificates and Delinquent Taxes Not Included in this !

Application,
17. Statutory (Opening) Bid; Total of Lines 7, 14, 15 (if applicable) and 16 (if

18. Redemption Fee 6.25

19. Total Amount to Redeem

Done this the 23rd day of January, 2017 Scott Lunsford, Tax Collector of

Date of Sale: 5////7 By

*This certification must be surrendered to the Clerk of the Circuit
05-5687-000 2014




Chris Jones

Real Estate
Search

Tangible Property
Search

I ECPA Home

Escambia County Property Appraiser

Amendment 1/Portability
Calculations

[ Printer Friendly Version

. Navigate Mode @ Account O Reference »

Reference: 1525306200006001

Account: 055687000

Owners: ALLEN ESTELLA

Mail: 10401 CEDAR CREEK DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32506

Situs: 9 S DAKOTA DR 32505

Use Code: VACANT RESIDENTIAL £

Taxing

Authority: COUNTY MSTU

Tax Inquiry: Open Tax Inquiry Window

Tax Inquiry link courtesy of Scott Lunsford
Escambia County Tax Coliector

Year Land Imprv Total Cap Val

2016 $4,500 $0 $4,500 $4,500

2015 $4,500 $0 $4,500 $4,500

2014 $4,500 $0 $4,500 $4,500
Disclaimer

Amendment 1/Portability Calculations

Sales Data

Official

Sale Date Book Page Value Type R(e;zu\-:’is
Window)

12/1999 4508 1287 $42,500 WD View Instr
06/1995 3791 137 $100 QC View Instr
01/1970 473 516 $100 WD View Instr

01/1969

459 535 $100 WD View Instr

Official Records inquiry courtesy of Pam Childers
Escambia County Clerk of the Circuit Court and

2016 Certified Roll Exemptions

None

Legal Description

LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508
P 1287

Extra Features

None

15-25-30-2

Approx.
Acreage:
0.2150

Zoned: e
MDR

Evacuation .
& Flood
Information
Open Report

Launch Interactive Map!

e} ‘t\l"‘\ola

= Pitog




4/15/03

The primary use of the assessment data is for the preparation of the current year tax roll. No responsibility or liability
is assumed for inaccuracies or errors.

Last Updated:02/15/2017 (tc.47653)
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Recorded in Public Records 02/28/2014 at 01:17 PM OR Book 7140 Page 806,
‘* Instryment #2014013804, Pam Childers Clerk of the Circuit Court Escambia
County, FL Recording $10.00

THE OFFICE OF ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT
SPECIAL MAGISTRATE
IN AND FOR ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

VS. Case No.: CE 13-01-00292
Location: 9 S. Dakota
Estella Allen PR# 152S8306200006001

10401 Cedar Creek Drive
Pensacola, FL 32506
ORDER

THIS CAUSE was brought before the Office of the Environmental Enforcement Special
Magistrate on Petitioner’s Certification of Costs, pursuant to the Special Magistrate’s Order of June
18, 2013; and the Special Magistrate having found the Respondent in violation of Escambia County
Code of Ordinances 42-196 (a) Nuisance Conditions, and 30-203 Accessory Building, Carport &
fences, and (cc). Escambia County made certain repairs to bring the property into compliance and
that the repairs were reasonable and necessary. Escambia County having given the Respondent
notice of the fines and abatement costs and the Respondent having failed to timely object thereto.
THEREFORE, the Special Magistrate being otherwise fully advised of the premises; it is hereby
ORDERED, pursuant to Section 30-35 of the Escambia County Code of Ordinances, that in addition
to the costs of $1,100.00 imposed by the Order of Special Magistrate dated June 18, 2013, the

following itemized fines and abatement fees are hereby imposed as follow:

[temized Cost
a. Fines ($50.00 per day 6/26/13 - 12/24/13) $ 9,050.00
b. County Abatement Fees $9.500.00
Total $ .00 which

together with the previously imposed costs of $1,100.00 makes a total of $19,650.00.
DONE AND ORDERED at Escambia County, Florida, this _ 2§ rﬁay of Feetany ,2014.

Spea‘% Magi?f‘rate

Office of Environmental Enforcement
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You have the right to appeal orders of the Special Magistrate to the

Circuit Court of Escambia County. If you wish to appeal, you must give notice of such in

writing to both the Environmental Enforcement Division at Escambia Central Office Complex, 3363

W. Park Place, Pensacola, Florida 32504 and the Escambia County Circuit Court at the M.C.
Blanchard Judicial Building, 190 Governmental Center, Pensacola, Florida 32501, no later than 30
days from the date of this Order. Failure to timely file a Written Notice of Appeal will waive your
o] al.

Jurisdiction is retained to enter such further orders as may be appropriate and

necessary.,

DONE AND ORDERED at Escambia County, Floridaonthe __[87% _day
of Jure ,2013.

/ ; Jegzy T. %ucr

Special Magistrate
Office of Environmental Enforcement

e R e



BK: 7041 ©PG: 1043

BK: 7041 pPG: 871

If you fail to fully correct the violation within the time required, you

will be assessed a fine of §_Q0 . OO  per day, commencing Jurs- 26 2013,

This daily fine shall continue until this violation is abated and the violation brought into

compliance or until as otherwise provided by law. YOU ARE REQUIRED,

immediately upon your full correction of this violation(s), to contact the Escambia County

Environmental Enforcement Office in writing to request that they immediately inspect the
property to make an official determination of whether the violation has been abated and
brought into compliance. If the violation is not abated within the specified time period, then
the County may elect to take whatever measures are necessary to abate the violation for you
These measures could include, but are not limited to, DEMOLISHING YOUR
STRUCTURE(S), LEGALLY DISPOSING OF ALL CONTRIBUTING CONDITIONS,
AND TOWING OF DESCRIBED VEHICLE(S). The reasonable cost of such will be
assessed against you and will constitute a lien on the property.

Costs in the amount of $ /9.0 0 _are awarded in favor of Escambia County
as the prevailing party against _ Esyecea Auisy

This fine shall be forwarded to the Board of County Commissioners. Under

the authority of 162.09(1) F.S. and Sec. 30-34(d) of the Code of Ordinances, the Board of

County Commissioners will certify to the Special Magistrate all costs imposed pursuant to

this order. All Monies owing hereunder shall constitute a lien on ALL YOUR REAL
AND PERSONAL PROPERTY including any property involved herein, which

lien can be enforced by foreclosure and as provided by law.
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B/ Complete removal of all contributing nuisance conditions; trash, rubbish, overgrowth

a

O 0O 0O o o o o

and legally dispose of. Maintain clean conditions to avoid a repeat violation,
Fivt /V# pooc

Remove vehicle. Repair vehicle or store in rear yard behind 6’ opaque fencing

1rLUMpo- PPV
Obtain building permit and restore structure'fo current building codes or, obtain

demolition permit and remove the structure(s), legally disposing of all debris.

Remove all structures, signs, vehicles, etc. from County ROW; refrain from further

obstruction.

Subscribe for residential waste collection with a legal waste collection service and

comply with solid waste disposal methods
Immediately cease burning and refrain from future burning
Remove all refuse and dispose of legally and refrain from future littering

Rezone property and conform to all performance standards or complete

" removal of the commercial or industrial entity

Obtain necessary permits or cease operations
Acquire proper permits or remove sign(s)

Other

Other

Other

Other

Other
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%}_nsaﬂjg Building; Described as 0 Main Structure & Accessory Building(s)
D(a)D(b)D(C)D(d)D(e)D(f)D(s)D(h)D(i)U(j)U(k)D(l)U(m)D(n)D(O)
DEU@OIMOEOMOMOEMOMWIXIEY)D@)0 (aa) O (bb) ®{cc) O (dd)
94-51 Obstruction of County Right-of-Way (ROW)

82-171 Mandatory Residential Waste Collection

82-15 Iliegal Buming

82-5 Littering Prohibited

LDC Article 6 Commercial in residential and non permitted use

LDC 4.01.02 and LDC 4.01.04 Land Disturbance without permits

LDC 8.03.02 and COO 86-91 Prohibited Signs, Un-permitted Sign ROW

Other

Other

Other

Other

Other

Other

Repeat violation(s)

THEREFORE, The Special Magistrate being otherwise fully advised in

the premises; it is hereby ORDERED that: __EsrBen Atipw
shall have until Jure 2.8 » 2013 to correct the violation and to bring the violation

into compliance. Corrective action shall include:




. Recorded in Public Records 07/03/2013 at 04:10 PM OR Book 7041 Page 1040,
Instrument #2013049221, Pam Childers Clerk of the Circuit Court Escambia
Ccunty, FL Recording $44.00

Recorded in Public Records 07/03/2013 at 03:35 PM OR Book 7041 Page 868,
Instrument #2013049164, Pam Childers Clerk of the Circuit Court Escambia
County, FL Recording $44.00

THE OFFICE OF ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT
SPECIAL MAGISTRATE
IN AND FOR THE
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA, STATE OF FLORIDA

ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
VS.

CASE NO: CE#13-01-00292

LOCATION: 9 South Dakota

PR# 152S30-6200-006-001

Estella Allen
10401 Cedar Creek Drive
Pensacola, Florida 32506

ORDER

This CAUSE having come before the Office of Environmental

Enforcement Special Magistrate on the Petition of the Environmental Enforcement

Officer for alleged violation of the ordinances of the County of Escambia, State of

Florida and the Special Magistrate having considered the evidence before him/her in

the form of testimony by the Enforcement Officer and the respondent or

representative, ESTELLA 'A»LLEU - as well as evidence submitted and after

consideration of the appropriate sections of the Escambia County Code of Ordinances,

the Special Magistrate finds that a violation of the following Code of Ordinance(s) has

occurred and continues

cd

0
O

42-196 (a) Nuisance Conditions
42-196 (b) Trash and Debris
42-196 (c) Inoperable Vehicle(s); Described

CIRCPRRTIFIED TO BE A TRUE COPY OF THE

e A FICE

£87 [GHES MY HAND AND OFFICIAL SEAL
42-196 (d) Overgrowth EXE A2 PAMCHILDERS™ ius'™

32% d K A FHE CIRCUIT COURT & COMPTROLLER

... A NTY FLORIDA
““'ieﬂl"’. L . C.
BATE Y- 2-
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CHINA CHERYL LIVELY
Notary Public-State of FL
Comm. Exp. Sept. 29, 2011

of equity to foreclose liens in the manner in which a mortgage lien is foreclosed or as collection
and enforcement of payment may be accomplished by other methods authorized by law.

Executed this_Zs«d._ day of Marcs 2011 by the County
Administrator as authorized by the Escambia County Board of County Commissioners.

g,uy;u/\ l i ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Witness ’

Print Name Susan Hendrix”

Witness L&afr\r\ Eﬁ)\_\r\ Coosae R-00en 3hA/

Print Name o\ A0 (Aveen By: Charles R. “Randy” Oliver, CPA PE
County Administrator
221 Palafox Place, Suite 420
Pensacola, FL 32502

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this °Z’“-‘ day of

, 2011, by Charles R. “Randy” Oliver, as County Administrator for

Escahbia County, Florida, on behalf of the Board of County Commissioners. He /) is

personally known to me, or () has produced current as
identification.

Comm. No. DD 684413 CHINA CHERYL LIVELY
(Notary Seal) Printed Name of Notary Public

S



, Recorded in Public Records 03/14/2011 at 04:11 PM OR Book 6699 Page 250,
" Instrument #2011016789, Ernie Lee Magaha Clerk of the Circuit Court Escambia
County, FL Recording $18.50

This document prepared by: CE100603621
Escambia County, Florida
Environmental Enforcement Division

6708 Plantation Rd.
Pensacola, FL 32504
(850) 471-6160
NOTICE OF LIEN
(Nuisance Abatement)
STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

This lien is imposed by Escambia County, Florida, for certain costs incurred by the
County to abate violations of the County Nuisance Abatement Ordinance, Sections 42-191 — 42-
198, Escambia County Code of Ordinances, on property owned by Estella Allen located at 9 S
Dakota Dr. and more particularly described as:

PR#1528306200006001
LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287

A field investigation by the Office of Environmental Enforcement was conducted on
November 24, 2010 revealed the property to be in violation of the following provisions of the
Escambia County Nuisance Abatement Ordinance: 42-196(a), (b), and (d)

Following notice and written demand to the owner by certified mail, return receipt
requested, and posting in accordance with Section 42-164, Escambia County Code of
Ordinances, and the owner having not abated the violation or requested or demonstrated at a
hearing before the Escambia County Board of County Commissioners that the property is not in
violation of the referenced provisions of the ordinance within ten days of the date of the written
demand (or in the case of a repeat violation, within three days of the date of the written demand)
the County abated the violations and incurred the following costs, which shall constitute a lien
against the property:

Abatement costs $475.00
Administrative costs $250.00

Total $725.00

The principal amount of this lien shall bear interest at a rate of 8% per annum; provided,
however, that no interest shall accrue until the 30™ day after the filing of the lien in the official
records of the Clerk of the Circuit Court. This lien may be enforced at any time by the Board of
County Commissioners after 30 days from the date of recording this Notice of Lien to recover
the amount due, together with all costs and reasonable attorneys’ fees, by proceeding in a court
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Escambia Count » f-!'lﬁ?d?
INSTRUMENT 9;—694016

be secured by the lien of this mortgage.

10. Notwithstanding any other provisions hereof, Mortgagee shall under no circumstances be entitled to
collect any interest or other tpﬂymem hereunder which would render this instrument usurious as to the
Mortgagor under the laws of the State of Florida.

IN WITNESS

EREOF, the said Mortgagor has executed these presents, this the date and year first above
written.

[/
ESTELLAATLEN

v/
/ey
eSS TNz eoileg

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF GutampsA

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this Zy%ay of December, 1999 by ESTELLA ALLEN
who is/age personally _known e or who hc produced
e.A:A'AvAL-z‘:."..A:_; » .

RCD Dec 30, 1999 12:36 p=
Escasbia t‘.‘.ounty, Florida

ie Lee Magaha
ClerkE:;?lghe Circuit Court
INSTRUMENT 99-694016




' OR BK 4508 P61
{D Escambia County, Flﬁ?d;‘s

. \&)‘ INSTRUMENT 99-694016
.

By And Return To:
&, BOUTHEAST FITLE GROUP, LLP N 272/% ERMIE LEE Moo, e
T\ Address: 1101 N. Palafox Streef By: g L~ ,W
\, Pensacola, Fl 32501
P File # 99P-11073TMW/ e i G N

THIS IS A BALLOON NOTE/MORTGAGE AND THE FINAL PRINCIPAL PAYMENT OR THE
PRINCIPAL BALANCE DUE UPON MATURITY IS $10,354.41, TOGETHER WITH ACCRUED
INTEREST, IF ANY, AND ALL ADVANCES MADE BY THE MORTGAGEE UNDER THE TERMS
OF THE MORTGAGE.

MORTGAGE
STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

ESTELLA ALLEN, AN UNMARRIED WOMAN hereinafter called Mortgagor, in consideration of the principal

sum specified in the promissory note hereafter described, received from Kenneth Wayne Hogg , hereinafter called
Mortgagee (which terms Mortgagor and Mo shall be construed to include the plural as well as the singular,
whenever the context so permits or Almu'«), reby, on this 23RD day of December, 1999, mortgages to the
Mortgagee the real property in ESC TA County, Florida, described as follows:

LOT 6, BLOCK A, FIRST ADDITION TO OAKCREST, BEING A PORTION OF SECTION 15,
TOWNSHIP 2 SOUTH, RANGE 30 WEST, ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, ACCORDING TO
THE PLAT RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 3, PAGE 44 OF THE RECORDS OF SAID COUNTY,

as security for the payment of the following:

ofne pzomissory note of even date herewith in the principal sum of $10,625.00, payable according to the terms
of said note.

AND Mortgagor mortgages hereby all title hereafter acquired as well as title heretofore acquired and does fully
warrant title to said land and will defend the same against the lawful claims of all persons whomsoever, and
Mortgagor further agrees:

1. This mortgage shall also secure such future or additional advances as may be made by the Mortgagee or a
subsequent holder at the option of the Mortgages or the subscquent holder to the Mortgagor, or its successors
in title, for any purpose provided that all such advances are to be made within twenty years from the date of
this mortgage or within such lesser period of time as may hereafter be provided by law as prerequisite for
the sufficiency of actual notice or record notice of such optional futre or additional advances as against the
rights of creditors or subsequent purchasers for a valuable consideration. The total amount of indebtedness
secured by this mortgage may decrease or increase from time to time, but the total unpaid balance so secured
at any one time shall not exceed the amount of the initial promissory note described hereinabove or
$ . whichever is greater, plus interest thereon, and any disbursements made by the Mortgagee
pur. to the authority of this mortgage with interest on such disbursements.

To make all payments required by the note and this mortgage promptly when due.

To pay all taxes, assessments, licns and encumbrances on the property promptly when due. If they are not

promptly paid the Mortgagee may pay then without waiving the option to foreclose, and such payments, with

interest at a rate 2% higher than the note secured hereby or at the maximum rate allowed by law, whichever :
is lesser, shall be payable on demand by Mortgagee and shall be secured by this mortgage.

4. To keep all buildings now or hereafier present ou that land insured for the full insurable value thereof against £

fire, lightning and windstorm, and in addition thereto all other coverage required on properties mortgaged :
to Federal or State banks and savings and loan associations by Federal and State regulations regulating such
banks and savings and loan associations, including insurance against damage by flood, if such insurance is
available. Mortgagor shall furnish Mortgagee with said policy or policies of insurance which shall show
Montgagee as a loss payee thercon. If the mortgagor shall not do so, the Mortgagee may do so without
waiving the option to foreclose, and the cost thereof, with interest thereon from the date of payment at a rate
2% higher than the note secured hereby or at the maximum rate allowed by law, whichever is lesser, shall
be &ayable upon demand by Mortgagee and shall be secured by this mortgage. If any sum becomes payable
under such policy, the Mortgagee may apply it to the indebtedness secured by this mortgage, or may permit
the Mortgagor to use it for other s, without impairing the lien of this mortgage.

5. That it will not commit, permit, or suffer any waster, impairment or deterioration of the mortgaged property.
Upon the failure of the Mortgagor to keep the buildings on the property in good condition or repair,
Mortgagee may demand either the adequate repair of the buildings, an increase in the amount of security, or
the immediate repayment of the debt secured. Failure of the Mortgagor to comply with the demand of the
Mortgagee for a reasonable time shall constitute a breach of this mortgage.

6. To pay all expenses reasonable incurred by the Mortgagee because of failure of the Mortgagor to comply with
the agreements in the note or this mortgage, including reasonable attorneys' fees through all appeals. The
cost thereof, with interest thereon from the date of payment at the same rate as specified in the note, shall also
be secured by this mortgage.

7. That if any of the said installments of principal or interest due or payabie by the terms of said promissory note
is not paid when due, or if any agreement in this morigage other than the agreement to make the payments
is breached, the entire unpaid principal balance of the note plus interest, costs, and attorneys' fees, shall
immediately become duc at the option of the Mortgagee, and the Mortgagee may foreclose this mortgage in
the manner provided by law, and have the mortgaged property sold to satisfy or apply on the the indebtedness

W

hereby secured.
8. The rents and profits of the mo‘:t‘faged property are also hereby mortgaged, and if proccedings to foreclose
this mortgage shall be instituted, the court having jurisdiction thereof should appoint a receiver of the

mortgaged property, and apply those rents and profits to the indebtedness hereby secured, regardless of the
solvency otp the Mortgagor or the adequacy of the security.

9. If this is a junior mortgags the Mortgagor snaii pay all installments of principal and interest and perform each
and every covenant and obligation of the prior mortgage. Failure of the Mortgagor to do so shall constitute
a default hereunder. Upon the failure of the Mortgagor to do so, the Morttgagee may (but shall not be
required to) make such payments or perform such covenants or obligations and the cost of same, together with
interest at a rate 2% higher than the note secured hereby or at the maximum rate allowed by law, whichever
is lesser, shall be payable by the Mortgagor upon demand by the Mortgagee and shall
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Prepared By And Return To:
‘}dl‘jTHEAST TITLE GROUP, LLP
Address:

1101 N. Pejafox Street
Pensacola, F1 32501
SE File #99P-11073TMW/

Property Appraisers Parcel I.D. Number(s):
05-5687-000
Grantee(s) S.S.#(s):

WARRANTY DEED

THIS WARRANTY DEED made and executed the D}.lay of December, 1999 by KENNETH WAYNE
HOGG, A rrovrried ¥iard , hereinafter called the Grantor, to _ ESTELLA ALLEN , whose post office

addre;sis:q SouwT DaXpdo D Bensaccola Floride. 33505 | hereinafter called the
Grantee:

(Wherever used herein the terms "Grantor” and "Grantee" shall include singular and plural, heirs, legal representatives, and assigns
of individuals, and the successors and assigns of corporations, wherever the context so admits ar requires.)

WITNESSETH: That the Grantor, for and in consideration of the sum of TEN DOLLARS ($10.00) and other
valuable considerations, receipt whereof is hereby acknowledged, by these presents does grant, bargain, sell, alien, remise,
rcfl;?sc,dcon\{cy and confirm unto the Grantee all that certain land situate, lying and being in ESCAMBIA County, State
of Florida, viz:

LOT 6, BLOCK A, FIRST ADDITION TO OAKCREST, BEING A PORTION OF SECTION 15,
TOWNSHIP 2 SOUTH, RANGE 30 WEST, ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, ACCORDING TO THE
PLAT RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 3, PAGE 44 OF THE RECORDS OF SAID COUNTY.

Al‘ thisbox is checked, the Grantor warrants that the above described property is not his/her constitutional
homestead as defined by the laws of the State of Florida. He/she resides at
I N W™ Strzet Vewvmesna  Texos 79331 .

TOGETHER with all the tenements, hereditaments and appurtenances thereto belonging or in anywise
appertaining.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same in fee simple forever.

AND the Grantor hercby covenants with said Grantee that the Grantor is lawfully seized of said land in fee simple;
that the Grantor has good right and lawful authority to sell and convey said land, and hereby warrants the title to said land
and will defend the same against the lawful claims of all persons whomsoever; and that said land is free of all
encumbrances, except easements, restrictions and reservations of record, if any, and taxes accruing subsequent to December
31, 1999.

IN WITNESS WHEREQF, the said Grantor has signed and sealed these presents the day and year first above

Hopn e A Ao clrsy o~ fict
KENNETH AYNE BY C ES STALLIONS, HIS

ATTORNEY IN FACT
Address:

Witness: RCD Dec 30, 1999 12:36 ps
Address: Escambia bounty, Florida

Witness: Ernie Lee Magaha
Clerk of the Circuit Court
STATE OF FLORIDA INSTRUMENT 99-694014

COUNTY OF ESctrrbio—

I hereby certify that on this day, before me, an officer duly authorized in the State and County aforesaid to take
acknowledgements, personally appeared CHARLES STALLIONS AS ATTORNEY IN FACT FOR KENNETH WAYNE
HOGG, who produced the identification described)below, and who acknowledged before me that they executed the

foregoing instrument. ]
Witness my hand and official seal in the coun ) F&y of December, 1999.

e e e o e o ¥



SOUTHERN GUARANTY TITLE COMPANY
4400 BAYOU BLVD., SUITE 13-B, CORDOVA SQUARE
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32503
TEL. (850) 478-8121 FAX (850) 476-1437
Email: rcsgt@aol.com

Scott Lunsford
Esczmbia County Tax Collector

P.0. Box 1312
Pensacola, FL 32591

CERTIFICATION: TITLE SEARCH FOR TDA

TAX DEED SALE DATE: 5-1-2017

T2X ACCOUNT NO.: 05-5687-000

CERTIFICATE NO.: 2014-2813

In compliance with Section 187.256, Florida Statutes, the following
is a list of names and addresses of those persons, firms and/cr
agencies having legal interest in or claim agalnst the zbove
Gescribed property. The above referenced tax sale certificate is
being submitted as proper noLlflcatlon of tax dsed sale.
YES NO
. X ©Notify City of Pensacola, P.0O. Bex 12910, 32521
221 palafox Place, 4th Floor/ ‘
X Notify Escambia County, 190 Governmental Center, 32502

l><|

Homestead for , tax vear.

Estella Allen
10401 Cedar Creek Dr.
Pensacola, FL 32506

Kenneth Wayne Hogg
Address unknown

Escambia County Code Enforcemeht
3363 West Park Place
Pensacola, FL 32505

fi2d and delivered to Escambia County Tax Collector,
20th day of February - , 2017 .

OUTHERN GUARANTY TITLE COMPANY

/

g, President




OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
CONTINUATION PAGE

File No.: 13381 February 16, 2017

UNSATISFIED MORTGAGES, LIENS AND JUDGMENTS AFFECTING THE LAND COVERED BY THIS
REPORT THAT APPEAR OF RECORD:

l. That certain mortgage executed by Estella Allen in favor of Kenneth Wayne Hogg dated 12/23/1999 and
recorded 12/30/1999 in Official Records Book 4508, page 1295 of the public records of Escambia County,
Florida, in the original amount of $10,625.00.

2. Nuisance Abatement Lien filed by Escambia County recorded in O.R. Book 6699, page 250.

3. Code Enforcement Lien filed by Escambia County recorded in O.R. Book 7041, page 1040, as amended
in O.R. Book 7140, page 806.

4. Taxes for the year 2013-2016 delinquent. The assessed value is $4,500.00. Tax ID 05-5687-000.

PLEASE NOTE THE FOLLOWING:

Subject to current year taxes.

Taxes and assessments due now or in subsequent years.

Subject to Easements, Restrictions and Covenants of record.

Encroachments, overlaps, boundary line disputes, and any other matters which would be
disclosed by an accurate survey and inspection of the premises.

Oil, gas and mineral or any other subsurface rights of any kind or nature.

oWy
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OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

File No.: 13381 February 16, 2017

Lot 6, Block A, First Addition to Oakcrest, as per plat thereof, recorded in Plat Book 3, Page 44, of the
Public Records of Escambia County, Florida
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Southern Guaranty Title Company
4400 Bayou Boulevard, Suite 13B .
Pensacola, Florida 32503 -
Telephone: 850-478-8121 ’
Facsimile: 850-476-1437

OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
File No.: 13381 February 16,2017
Escambia County Tax Collector

P.O. Box 1312
Pensacola, Florida 32591

Pursuant to your request, the Company has caused a search to be made of the Public Records of Escambia
County, Florida, solely as revealed by records maintained from 02-16-1997, through 02-16-2017, and said
search reveals the following:

1. THE GRANTEE(S) OF THE LAST DEED(S) OF RECORD IS:
Estella Allen
2. The land covered by this Report is:
LEGAL DESCRIPTION IS ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

3. The following unsatisfied mortgages, liens and judgments affecting the land covered by this Report
appear of record:

SEE CONTINUATION PAGE ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF
4, Taxes:
SEE CONTINUATION PAGE ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

The foregoing report is prepared and furnished for information only, is not intended to constitute or imply any
opinion, warranty, guaranty, insurance, or similar assurance as to the status of title, and no determination has
been made of the authenticity of any instrument described or referred to herein. The name search for the
purposes of determining applicable judgments and liens is limited to the apparent record owner(s) shown herein,
No attempt has been made to determine whether the land is subject to liens or assessments which are not shown
as existing liens by the public records. The Company's liability hereunder shall not exceed the cost of this
Report, or $1,000.00 whichever is less.

THIS REPORT SHALL NOT BE USED FOR THE ISSUANCE OF TITLE INSURANCE.

Southern Guaranty Title Com 2
B — February 16, 2017

ez



WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON May 1, 2017,
UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT
THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY COURTHOUSE IN
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15 holder of Tax Certificate
No. 02813, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2014 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287
SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 2 S, RANGE 30 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 055687000 (17-194)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
ESTELLA ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of May, which is the 1st day
of May 2017.

Dated this 16th day of March 2017.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

Personal Services:

ESTELLA ALLEN PAM CHILDERS
10401 CEDAR CREEK DR CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
PENSACOLA, FL 32506 ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:

"&‘w‘ & Emily H
NSO y Hogg
S Deputy Clerk




WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON May 1, 2017,
UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT
THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY COURTHOUSE IN
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15 holder of Tax Certificate
No. 02813, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2014 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287
SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 2 S, RANGE 30 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 055687000 (17-194)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
ESTELLA ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of May, which is the 1st day
of May 2017.

Dated this 16th day of March 2017.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

Post Property: PAM CHILDERS
9 S DAKOTA DR 32505 CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
N ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
-“,GOMPTQ‘\\‘
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By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk




WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON May 1, 2017,
UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT
THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY COURTHOUSE IN
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FLI15 holder of Tax Certificate
No. 02813, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2014 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287
SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 2 S, RANGE 30 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 055687000 (17-194)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
ESTELLA ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of May, which is the 1st day
of May 2017.

Dated this 16th day of March 2017.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk




STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

CERTIFICATE OF NOTICE OF MAILING
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

CERTIFICATE # 02813 of 2014
I, PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY,

FLORIDA, do hereby certify that I did on March 16, 2017, mail a copy of the foregoing Notice of
Application for Tax Deed, addressed to:

ESTELLA ALLEN
10401 CEDAR CREEK DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32506

ESCAMBIA COUNTY

OFFICE OF COUNTY ATTORNEY
221 PALAFOX PLACE STE 430
PENSACOLA FL 32502

ESCAMBIA COUNTY OFFICE OF CODE ENFORCEMENT
ESCAMBIA CENTRAL OFFICE COMPLEX

3363 WEST PARK PLACE

PENSACOLA FL 32505

KENNETH WAYNE HOGG
ADDRESS UNKNOWN

ESTELLA ALLEN
9 SOUTH DAKOTA DR
PENSACOLA FL 32505

WITNESS my official seal this 16th day of March 2017.

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk




' 0057721

WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON May 1, 2017,
UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT
THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY COURTHOUSE IN

PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15 holder of Ta?tertiﬁgate
No. 02813, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2014 has filed same in my office and has made ] atlogor a

tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certlﬁcate embraces the following described properiys Com&y of A
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit: < -'T1 e = m
=mx _ O
LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287 "-i‘ mg L f_";l
=Rc ; <
""-nz U
SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 2 S, RANGE 30 W — m
R - |
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 055687000 (17-194) - :

The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of

ESTELLA ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of May, which is the 1st day

of May 2017.

Dated this 16th day of March 2017.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

Personal Services:

ESTELLA ALLEN PAM CHILDERS
10401 CEDAR CREEK DR CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
PENSACOLA, FL 32506 ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:
Emily Hogg
Deputy Clerk




. ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE |7 - IﬁL‘
v ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA 7

NON-ENFORCEABLE RETURN OF SERVICE

Document Number: ECSO17CIV014082NON Agency Number: 17-005721
Court: TAX DEED

County: ESCAMBIA

Case Number: CERT NO 02813 2014

Attorney/Agent:

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF COURT
TAX DEED

Plaintiff: RE: ESTELLA ALLEN
Defendant:

Type of Process: NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

Individual

Received this Writ on 3/16/2017 at 2:07 PM and served same on ESTELLA ALLEN , at 9:31 AM on 3/24/2017 in
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, by delivering a true copy of this Writ together with a copy of the initial pleadings, if any,
with the date and hour of service endorsed thereon by me.

DAVID MORGAN, SHERIFF
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By: ’/’;?S///Wg-

HNSTON
Service Fee: .00
Receipt No: ILL

Printed By: DLRUPERT




' 0056677

WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON May 1, 2017,
UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT
THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY COURTHOUSE IN

PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15 holder of Tax Certificate
No. 02813, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2014 has filed same in my office and has made @pplication for a
rg' the GRinty of

m b

tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described prope:

Escambia, State of Florida, to wit: 3 0
LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287 §::-,1 b _ O
Zd -
SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 2 S, RANGE 30 W =3 % v <
i o S m
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 055687000 (17-194) o< oy D

n [

U imy

The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of

ESTELLA ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at public auction at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of May, which is the 1st day

of May 2017.

Dated this 16th day of March 2017.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability who
needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision of
certain assistance. Please contact Emily Hogg not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at Escambia
County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-595-3793.

Post Property: PAM CHILDERS
9 S DAKOTA DR 32505 CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
By:
Emily Hogg

Deputy Clerk




ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFF]CE
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

NON-ENFORCEABLE RETURN OF SERVICE I7-19Y

Document Number: ECSO17CIV014179NON Agency Number: 17-005667
Court: TAX DEED

County: ESCAMBIA

Case Number: CERT NO 02813 2014

Attorney/Agent:

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF COURT
TAX DEED

Plaintiff: RE: ESTELLA ALLEN
Defendant:

Type of Process: NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

Received this Writ on 3/16/2017 at 2:04 PM and served same at 9:00 AM on 3/21/2017 in ESCAMBIA COUNTY,
FLORIDA, by serving POST PROPERTY |, the within named, to wit: , .

POSTED TO PROPERTY AS INSTRUCTED BY CLERK'S OFFICE.

DAVID MORGAN, SHERIFF
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By: ) . ﬁ'ﬂ" 15

J. ANGLIN, CPS

Service Fee: $40.00
Receipt No: BILL

Printed By: DLRUPERT




Pam Childers < ‘) :
Clerk of the Circuit Court & Comptroller NEOPOST
Official Records 03/16/2017 0
SR $005.26°
ZIP 32502

221 Palafox Place, Suite 110
Pensacola, FL 32502
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ESTELLA ALLEN [17-194]
10401 CEDAR CREEK DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32506

9171 9690 0935 0129 0812 84

ESTELLA ALLEN [17-194]
9 SOUTH DAKOTA DR
PENSACOLA FL 32505

9171 9690 0935 0129 081277
2.2%-Y mﬁNNEd\L b e

ESCAMBIA COUNTY OFFICE OF
CODE ENFORCEMENT [17-194]
3363 WEST PARK PLACE
PENSACOLA FL 32505

9171 9690 0935 0129 0812 53

KENNETH WAYNE HOGG [17-194]
ADDRESS UNKNOWN

ESCAMBIA COUNTY [17-194]
OFFICE OF COUNTY ATTORNEY
221 PALAFOX PLACE STE 430
PENSACOLA FL 32502

9171 9690 0935 0129 0812 60




Escambla P
/ § PUBLISHED WEEKLY SINCE 1948

(Warrington) Pensacola, Escambia County, Florida

STATE OF FLORIDA

County of Escambia

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared Michael P. Driver
who is personally known to me and who on oath says that he is

Publisher of The Escambia Sun Press, a weekly newspaper

published at (Warrington) Pensacola in Escambia County,
Florida; that the attached copy of advertisement, being a
NOTICE in the matter of SALE
05-01-2017 — TAX CERTIFICATE # 02813
in the Court

was published in said newspaper in the issues of
MARCH 30 & APRIL 6, 13. & 20,2017

Affiant further says that the said Escambia Sun-Press is a
newspaper published at (Warrington) Pensacola, in said
Escambia County, Florida, and that the said newspaper has
heretofore been continuously published in said Escambia County,
Florida each week and has been entered as second class mail
matter at the post office in Pensacola, in said Escambia County,
Florida, for a period of omne year next preceding the first
publication of the attached copy of advertisement; and affiant
further says that he has neither paid nor promised any person,
firm or corporation any discount, rebate, commission or refund
for the purpose of securing this advertisement for publication
in the said newspaper.

/o

AS CSTFORBBURYFW-FLHW
of Tax Certificate No. 02813, tised the 1t

" day of June, AD.,; 2014haﬁlednmem

myoﬁcemdhumm-pphmfwa

this

PUBLISHER

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 20TH day of APRIL

A.D., 2017

Qau.—b- . JMP—*

PAULA D. TURNER

NOTARY PUBLIC
‘\;‘J\'v'%g,, PAULA D. TURNER
& °' . Notary Public - State of Florida
o - Commission #FF 999700
B £'~ My Commission Expires
RETCS August 24, 2020

: WWW&MW'?MW

_ _ thé Hilgh o
public: auction a 9:00:A.M.-of the first
Mondaym&mm‘mwﬁchisﬁe
lstdlyofMay2017 .
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Pam Childers

Official Records
221 Palafox Place, Suite 110
Pensacola, FL 32502
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ESTELLA ALLEN [1 7-194]
10401 CEDAR CREEK DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32506
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Recorded in Public Records 6/20/2017 3:00 PM OR Book 7731 Page 1695,
Instrument #2017046744, Pam Childers Clerk of the Circuit Court Escambia

County, FL Recording $10.00 Deed Stamps $16.80
I

This instrument was prepared by:

Pam Childers, Clerk of the Circuit Court
Escambia County Courthouse
Pensacola, Florida

Tax Deed File No. 17-194
Propertyldentification No. 1528306200006001
Tax Account No. 055687000

TAX DEED

State of Florida
County of Escambia

The following Tax Sale Certificate Numbered 02813 issued on June 1, 2014 was filed in the office
of the tax collector of this County and application made for the issuance of a tax deed, the applicant having
paid or redeemed all other taxes or tax sale certificates on the land described as required by law to be paid or
redeemed, and the costs and expenses of this sale, and due notice of sale having been published as required

; by law, and no person entitled to do so having appeared to redeem said land; such land was on the 1st day of
: May 2017, oftered for sale as required by law for cash to the highest bidder and was sold to: TWR AS CST
H FOR EBURY FUND FL1S, PO BOX 54876 NEW ORLEANS LA 70154, being the highest bidder and
: having paid the sum of his bid as required by the Laws of Florida.

Now, on this 1st day of May 2017, in the County of Escambia, State of Florida, in consideration of
the sum of ($2,393.86) TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED NINETY THREE AND 86/100 Dollars,
being the amount paid pursuant to the Laws of Florida does hereby scll the following lands, including any

j hereditaments, buildings, fixtures and improvements of any kind and description, situated in the County and
i State aforesaid and described as follows:

LOT 6 BLK A 1ST ADDN TO OAKCREST PB 3 P 44 OR 4508 P 1287

SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 2 S, RANGE 30 W

ALy,
** Property previously assessed to: ESTELLA ALLEN é.\:;‘oi Glﬁg;;‘:,'
& & 7Y,
EEAY j °F
™ - — %o, AT
PAM CHILDERS, Clerk of the Circuit Court ".Zcéz;-----—“g‘i“s
Escambia County, Florida CAALAIE
witne: ind} Johnson
! ess Hogg
. State of Florida
: County of Escambia
"
j ofF dwe 0
i On this l qJ—k O‘: \ before me Emily Hogg personally appeared Pam Childers, Clerk of
; the Circuit Court in and for ¥aé State and this County known to me to be the person described in, and who
executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged the execution of this instrument to be his own free act
and deed for the use and purposes therein mentioned.
Witness my hand and official seal date aforesaid.
S
PA of the Circuit Cougeed o,
@ WA\’%:"—.
, B A7 g3
; - o jas
i Emily Hogg, Deputy :‘C;;}\ }; :~=-
5 SF

00 JUNTY
RITIRRE
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& Sun Press

PUBLISHED WEEKLY SINCE 1948
(Warrington) Pensacola, Escambia County, Florida

STATE OF FLORIDA

County of Escambia

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared Michael P. Driver
who is personally known to me and who on oath says that he is

Publisher of The Escambia Sun Press, a weekly newspaper

published at (Warrington) Pensacola in Escambia County,
Florida; that the attached copy of advertisement, being a
NOTICE in the matter of SALE
05-01-2017 -~ TAX CERTIFICATE # 02813
in the Court

was published in said newspaper in the issues of
MARCH 30 & APRIL 6. 13. & 20,2017

Affiant further says that the said Escambia Sun-Press is a
newspaper published at (Warrington) Pensacola, in said
Escambia County, Florida, and that the said newspaper has
heretofore been continuously published in said Escambia County,
Florida each week and has been entered as second class mail
matter at the post office in Pensacola, in said Escambia County,
Florida, for a period of one year next preceding the first
publication of the attached copy of advertisement; and affiant
further says that he has neither paid nor promised any person,
firm or ceorporation any discount, rebate, commission or refund
for the purpose of securing this advertisement for publication
in the said newspaper.

2

PUBLISHER

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 20TH day of APRIL

A.D., 2017

O bR . J\M»F‘-“

PAULA D. TURNER
NOTARY PUBLIC

“i. PAULA D. TURNER

2 %, . Notary Public - State of Florida

5':@7 Z Commission #FF 999700
78 My Commission Expires

August 24, 2020
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Pam Childers

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA
INST# 2017046743 6/20/2017 3.00 PM

STATE OF FLORIDA Recorang S1880 00 Do Tvpe: COM

COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

CERTIFICATE OF NOTICE OF MAILING
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

CERTIFICATE # 02813 of 2014
I, PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY,

FLORIDA, do hereby certify that I did on March 16, 2017, mail a copy of the foregoing Notice of
Application for Tax Deed, addressed to:

ESTELLA ALLEN
10401 CEDAR CREEK DR
PENSACOLA, FL 32506

ESCAMBIA COUNTY

OFFICE OF COUNTY ATTORNEY
221 PALAFOX PLACE STE 430
PENSACOLA FL 32502

ESCAMBIA COUNTY OFFICE OF CODE ENFORCEMENT
ESCAMBIA CENTRAL OFFICE COMPLEX

3363 WEST PARK PLACE

PENSACOLA FL 32505

KENNETH WAYNE HOGG
ADDRESS UNKNOWN

ESTELLA ALLEN
9 SOUTH DAKOTA DR
PENSACOLA FL 32505

WITNESS my official seal this 16th day of March 2017.

PAM CHILDERS
SN, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
T COMPrY,
_?\g-_ ---------- o, ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
F9. Y
’l" Ll A@ : ;
S h o ':
M o O
A ST By
Emily Hogg

Deputy Clerk




AM CERTIFICATES
02/17/2017 9:38:31 TAX DEED
A D1 APPLICATION 60.00 60.00 0.00 0.00
02/17/2017 9:38:31] 1, ONLINE AUCTION 20.00 70.00 0.00 0.00
AM FEE
Total 450.00 450.00 0.00 0.00
RECEIPTS
ReceiptDate[ReceiptNumber Received_from payment_amt|applied_amtjrefunded_amt
et 2017016957 TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15 450.00 450.00 0.00
Total 450.00 450.00 0.00
REGISTRY
CashierDate | Type [TransactionID| TransactionName Name |Amount Status
04/28/2017 11:26:29|  Check 101091918 ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S [1700 W LEONARD| 0 [ 900026071 CLEARED
AM (outgoing) OFFICE ST : ON 4/28/2017
04/07/2017 9:56:56 |  Check 605 S OLD CORRY 900025976 CLEARED
AM (outgoing) 101084334 ESCAMBIA SUN PRESS PIELD RD 200.00 ON 4/7/2017
02/17/2017 1:30:15 | (oo 101064555 TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND 320.00 Deposit
PM FL15
Deposited Used Balance
320.00 15,680.00 -15,360.00




PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUIT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE OFFICIAL RECORDS
MENTAL HEALTH COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
MIS AUDITOR
OPERATIONAL SERVICES OFFICE OF THE
PROBATE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC
Case # 2014 TD 002813
Sold Date 05/01/2017
Name NO BID
RegistryOfCourtT = TAXDEED 0
overbidamount = TAXDEED $0.00
PostageT = TD2 $21.04
Researcher Copies = TD6 $11.00
prepFee = TD4 $14.00
advdocstampsdeed = TAXDEED $16.80
advancerecording = TAXDEED $18.50
AdvRecordingDeedT = TAXDEED $10.00
Date Docket Desc MVIEW IMAGES'
CASE FILED 06/01/2014 CASE NUMBER
06/01/2014 0101 2014 TD 002813
PAYMENT $450.00 RECEIPT
02/17/2017 RECEIPT #2017016957
02/21/2017 D83 TAX COLLECTOR CERTIFICATION
02/21/2017 TD84 PA'S PRINT OUT
03/07/2017 TD82 O & E REPORT
03/14/2017 TD81 CERTIFICATE OF MAILING
04/06/2017 TD84 SHERIFF'S RETURN OF SERVICE
CHECK (CHECKID 79377) VOIDED:
04/07/2017 CheckVoided ESCAMBIA SUN PRESS 605 S OLD
CORRY FIELD RD PENSACOLA, FL 32507
; CHECK PRINTED: CHECK # 900025976 -
04/07/2017 CheckMailed - REGISTRY CHECK
04/11/2017 TD84 CERTIFIED MAIL DELIVERY STATUS
CHECK (CHECKID 79989) VOIDED:
. ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE
04/28/2017 CheckVoided 1700 W LEONARD ST PENSACOLA, FL
32501
. CHECK PRINTED: CHECK # 900026071 -
04/28/2017 CheckMailed - REGISTRY CHECK
05/01/2017 TD84 PROOF OF PUBLICATION
FEES
EffectiveDate[FeeCode| FeeDesc |TotalFee|AmountPaid|WaivedAmount/AmountQOutstanding




PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS

CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUIT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE OFFICIAL RECORDS
MENTAL I;|EALTH COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
MI AUDITOR
OPERATIONAL SERVICES OFFICE OF THE
PROBATE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC

PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
No Bid Tax Deed Sale

Cert # 002813 of 2014 Date 05/01/2017

Name NO BID

Cash Summary

Cash Deposit | $0.00
Total Check 1$91.34
Grand Total 1 $91.34

Purchase Price $2,393.86 Opening Bid Amount $2,393.86 OverBid Amount $0.00

Total Check $91.34

Adv Recording Deed  $10.00
Adv Doc. Stamps $16.80
Postage $21.04

Researcher Copies $11.00

Adv Recording Mail Cert $18.50

Clerk's Prep Fee $14.00

Sheriff Services over $60

Legal Ad over $165

Total Extra TD Registry of Court Fees 0

PAM CHILDERS
Clerk of the Circuit Court

By:
Deputy Clerk

Escambia County Government Complex « 221 Palafox Place Ste 110 « PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
(850) 595-3793 « FAX (850) 595-4827 « http://www.clerk.co.escambia.fl.us




PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT
CIRCUIT CIVIL
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL
COUNTY CIVIL
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW
JURY ASSEMBLY
JUVENILE
MENTAL HEALTH
MIS
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE

TRAFFIC

COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA
OFFICE OF THE
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

No Bid Tax Deed Sale

Cash Deposit | $0.00
Cert # 002813 of 2014 Date 05/01/2017 Total Check 331 -gj
Name NO BID Grand Total | $91.

BRANCH OFFICES

ARCHIVES AND RECORDS

JUVENILE DIVISION
CENTURY

CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OFFICIAL RECORDS
COUNTY TREASURY
AUDITOR

Cash Summary

—U0 .

PAM CHILDERS
Clerk of the Circuit C S]'%L‘

By:

Deputy Clerk

Escambia County Government Complex * 221 Palafox Place Ste 110 - PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
(850) 595-3793 « FAX (850) 595-4827 « http://www.clerk.co.escambia.fl.us
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Pam Childers

Clerk of the Circuit Court and Comptroller, Escambia County

Clerk of Courts » County Comptroller ¢ Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners ¢ Recorder ¢

May 2, 2017

TWR AS CST FOR EBURY FUND FL15
PO BOX 54876
NEW ORLEANS LA 70154

Dear Certificate Holder:

The records of this office show that an application for a tax deed had been made on the properties
represented by the numbered certificates listed below. These properties were presented at auction on MAY 1,
2017 with “no bids”. Please remit the following recording fees. These fees must be sent to our office NO
LATER THAN MAY 23, 2017. Thank you and have a great day.

CERT NUMBER RECORDING FEES CREDIT TOTAL
2014 TD 002813 $91.34 ($40.00) $51.34
2014 TD 002826 $117.36 ($40.00) $77.36
2014 TD 003018 $143.10 ($40.00) $103.10
2014 TD 003357 $109.62 ($40.00) $69.62
TOTAL $301.42

***ALL FEES DUE BY MAY 23, 2017

Very truly yours,
PAM CHILDERS
Clerk-of Circuit Cou

By:
Emily Hogg
Tax Deed Division

Tax Deeds * 221 Palafox Place * Suite 110 ¢ Pensacola, FL 32502
Telephone 850-595-3793 » OR@EscambiaClerk.com




