This is to certify that the holder listed below of Tax Sale Certificate Number 2008 / 8081 |,

FORM 513
(r.12/00)

TAX COLLECTOR'S CERTIFICATION

Application
Date / Number

Mar 7, 2011 / 110179

issued the

30th day of May, 2008, and which encumbers the following described property located in the County of Escambia, State of
Florida to wit: Parcel ID Number: 13-1595-000

Certificate Holder:

COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA C/O TAX COLLECTOR
P O BOX 1312

PENSACOLA, FLLORIDA 32591

Property Owner:

ALLEN FRED L

C/O SYLVIA ALLEN

PO BOX 271

CASSANOVA, VIRGINIA 22017

Legal Description: 00-0S0-090
E64/10 FT OF LT 11 AND W 17 4/10 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK 71 BELMONT TRACT CA 94

has surrendered same in my office and made written application for tax deed in accordance with Florida Statutes. | certify
that the following tax certificates, interest, ownership and encumbrance report fee, and Tax Collector's fees have been paid:

CERTIFICATES OWNED BY APPLICANT AND FILED IN CONNECTION WITH THIS TAX DEED APPLICATION:

Cert. Year | Certificate Number Date of Sale Face Amt T/C Fee " Interest Total
2010 10906 06/01/10 $243.80 $0.00 $36.57 $280.37
2009 10196 06/01/09 $241.62 $0.00 . $79.73 $321.35
2008 8081 05/30/08 $243.69 $0.00 $127.94 $371.63

CERTIFICATES REDEEMED BY APPLICANT OR INCLUDED (COUNTY) IN CONNECTION WITH THIS APPLICATION:

Cert. Year | Certificate Number Date of Sale Face Amt T/C Fee Interest Total

2007 6726 06/01/07 $217.15 $6.25 $149.84 $373.24

2006 8392 06/01/06 $176.13 $6.25 $153.24 $335.62

2005 5698 06/01/05 $95.69 $6.25 $71.17 $173.11

2004 7524 06/01/04 $86.01 $6.25 $70.53 $162.79

1. Total of all Certificates in Applicant's Possession and Cost of the Certificates Redeemed by

Applicant or Included (County) $2,018.11
2. Total of Delinquent Taxes Paid by Tax Deed Application $0.00
3. Total of Current Taxes Paid by Tax Deed Applicant (2010) $164.67
4. Ownership and Encumbrance Report Fee $150.00
5. Tax Deed Application Fee $75.00
6. Total Certified by Tax Collector to Clerk of Court $2,407.78
7. Clerk of Court Statutory Fee
8. Clerk of Court Certified Mail Charge
9. Clerk of Court Advertising Charge

10. Sheriff's Fee

1.

12. Total of Lines 6 thru 11 $2,407.78

13. Interest Computed by Clerk of Court Per Florida Statutes....( %) ‘

14. One-Half of the assessed value of homestead property. If applicable pursuant to section

197.502, F.S.
15. Statutory (Opening) Bid; Total of Lines 12 thru 14
16. Redemption Fee $6.25

17.

By
Date of Sale: gv‘h QALLQ/(A 0/20

* This certification must be surrendered to the Clerk of the Circuit Court no later than ten days after this date.

Total Amount to Redeem

*Done this 7th day of March, 2011

AX COLLLECTOR, ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

il Resh, CECR

Dinilo Wdza¢ Colliclrz




BRANCH OFFICES
ERNIE LEE MAGAHA ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
JUVENILE DIVISION

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

CENTURY

ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILD SUPPORT
CIRCUIT CIVIL
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL
COUNTY CIVIL
COUNTY CRIMINAL CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
DOMESTIC RELATIONS COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FAMILY LAW COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA
JURY ASSEMBLY OFFICIAL RECORDS
OFFICE OF THE COUNTY TREASURY
AUDITOR

JUVENILE

T CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

MIS
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE
TRAFFIC

IMAGING COVER PAGE

This cover page is not a part of the original documents but is
necessary to avoid obscuring any information on
the original documents

Case: 2008 TD 0080

Ay L 1 L]

Dkt TD83 Pg#

Original Documents Follow




SOUTHERN GUARANTY TITLE COMPANY
a 4400 BAYOU BLVD., SUITE 13-B, CORDCVA SQUARE
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32503
TEL. (850) 478-812 EAX (850) 476-1437
Email: resgt@aol.com '
Janet Holley
Escambia County Tax Collector

P.0. Box 1312
Pensacola, FL 32596

CERTIFICATION: TITLE SEARCH FOR TDA

TaX DEED SALE DATE: July 5, 2011

TAX ACCOUNT NO.: 13-1595-000

CERTIFICATE NO.: 2008-8081

In compliance with Section 197.256, Florida Statutes, the following

. is a list of names and addresses of those persons, Iirms and/or
agencies having legal interest in or claim against the above "=
described property. The above referenced tax sale certificate 1s
being submitted as proper notification of tax deed szle.

YES NO

X Notify City of pensacola, P.O. Box 12910, 32596

X Notify Escambia County, 190 Governmental Center, 32501
X Homestead for ___ tax vear.
Fred L. Allen, if alive, paniel Glowa
or his estate if deceased -~ 1779 Bridge Port Colony Lane
c/osylvia Allen Ft. Walton Beach, FL 32547
P.O. Box 271 :
Cassanova, VA 22017 JLSC Properties LIC

229 Sabine Dr.

Cert. Holders: pensacola Beach, FL 32561

Glass Living Trust
5510 Glass Dr. Lot 5
Pensacola, FL 32505

Richard Fett

15 W. Blo ‘

R U?E v

ef%?i?g& angEggﬁivered +o Escambia County Tax Collector,
t+his 15th day of April -, 2011,

SOUTHERN GUARANTY ,TITLE COMPANY

y: Richard S. Combs, President

NOTE: The above listed addresses aré.-based upon current information
available, but said addresses are not guaranteed to be true oOT

correct.



OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
CONTINUATION PAGE

File No.: 8631 , April 5, 2011

UNSATISFIED MORTGAGES, LIENS AND JUDGMENTS AFFECTING THE LAND COVERED BY THIS
REPORT THAT APPEAR OF RECORD:

1. Taxes for the year 2003-2009 delinquent. The assessed value is $8,479.00. Tax ID
13-1595-000.

PLEASE NOTE THE FOLLOWING:

Taxes and assessments due now or in subsequent years.

Subject to Easements, Restrictions and Covenants of record.

Oil, gas, mineral or any other subsurface rights of any kind or nature.

Encroachments, overlaps, boundary line disputes, and any other matters which would be
disclosed by an accurate survey and inspection of the premises.

oSawy



OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

File No.: 8631 April 5, 2011

000S009010112071 - Full Legal Description

E64/10 FTOF LT 11 AND W 17 4/10 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK 71 BELMONT TRACT CA 94

Couca N O
- LoeAEe  Aesy



I Southern Guaranty Title Company
4400 Bayou Boulevard, Suite 13B
Pensacola, Florida 32503
Telephone: 850-478-8121
Facsimile: 850-476-1437

OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT

File No.: 8631 April 5, 2011
Escambia County Tax Collector
P.O. Box 1312
Pensacola, Florida 32569
Pursuant to your request, the Company has caused a search to be made of the Public Records of Escambia
County, Florida, solely as revealed by records maintained from 04-05-91, through 04-05-11, and said search
reveals the following:
1. THE GRANTEE(S) OF THE LAST DEED(S) OF RECORD IS:

Fred L. Allen
2. The land covered by this Report is:

LEGAL DESCRIPTION IS ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

3. The following unsatisfied mortgages, liens and judgments affecting the land covered by this Report
appear of record:

SEE CONTINUATION PAGE ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF
" 4, Taxes:
SEE CONTINUATION PAGE ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

The foregoing report is prepared and furnished for information only, is not intended to constitute or imply any
opinion, warranty, guaranty, insurance, or similar assurance as to the status of title, and no determination has
been made of the authenticity of any instrument described or referred to herein. The name search for the
purposes of determining applicable judgments and liens is limited to the apparent record owner(s) shown herein,
No attempt has been made to determine whether the land is subject to liens or assessments which are not shown
as existing liens by the public records. The Company's liability hereunder shall not exceed the cost of this
Report, or $1,000.00 whichever is less.

THIS REPORT SHALL NOT BE USED FOR THE ISSUANCE OF TITLE INSURANCE.

Southern Guaranty Title Company

April 5,2011
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WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON July 5,
2011, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA holder of Tax Certificate No.
08081, issued the 30th day of May, A.D., 2008 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to'be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

E 64/10 FT OF LT 11 AND W 17 4/10 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK 71 BELMONT TRACT CA 94
SECTION 00, TOWNSHIP 0 S, RANGE 00 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 131595000 (11-381)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
FRED L ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A M. on the first Tuesday in the month of July, which is the
5th day of July 2011.

Dated this 2nd day of June 2011.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Post Property:
| 500 W DESOTO ST BLK 32501]  By: ,

R0\
R\
)
S
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RO,
.(_:,'...-..,,/7(\ s,

o

Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk



WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON July 5,
2011, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA holder of Tax Certificate No.
08081, issued the 30th day of May, A.D., 2008 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

E 6 4/10 FT OF LT 11 AND W 17 4/10 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK 71 BELMONT TRACT CA 94
SECTION 00, TOWNSHIP 0 S, RANGE 00 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 131595000 (11-381)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
FRED L ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Tuesday in the month of July, which is the
Sth day of July 2011.

Dated this 2nd day of June 2011.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

By: )

Deputy Clerk



STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

CERTIFICATE OF NOTICE OF MAILING
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

CERTIFICATE # 08081 of 2008

I, ERNIE LEE MAGAHA, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT OF ESCAMBIA
COUNTY, FLORIDA, do hereby certify that I did on June 2, 2011, mail a copy of the foregoing
Notice of Application for Tax Deed, addressed to:

FRED L ALLEN

C/O SYLVIA ALLEN

PO BOX 271
CASSANOVA, VA 22017

RICHARD FETT DANIEL GLOWA
115 W BLOUNT ST 1779 BRIDGE PORT COLONY LANE
PENSACOLA, FL 32501 | FT WALTON BEACH, FL 32547

JLSC PROPERTIES LLC
229 SABINE DR
PENSACOLA BEACH, FL 32561

GLASS LIVING TRUST
5510 GLASS DR. LOT 5
PENSACOLA, FL 32505

WITNESS my official seal this 2nd day of June 2011.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

SEAL
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7009 2250 D003 8599 8081

7009 2250 0003 8599 a043

U.S. Postal Service
CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

U.S. Postal Service w

CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)

For delivery information visit our we

Pz
=3
i

§)w
]

bsite at www.us

L.

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)
For delivery information visit our website at WWW.USpS.comg
Postage | $ O . W
7
CertiedFee [ . - f J/
Return Receipt Fee Postméa;k

(Endorsement Required) 2 . 30 . }UN 2 Here \ :

Restricted Delivery Fee m" I

(Endorsement Required) &

s ST |

s et
oo B
JLSC PROPERTIES LLC [11-381]
229 SABINE DR
PENSACOLA BEACH, FL 32561

Total Postage & Fees

U.S. Postal Service
CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)
Tt

Certified Fee

Return Receipt Fee

(Endorsement Required)

Restricted Delivery Fee
(Endorsement Required)

Total Postage & Fees $ f j 7
Sent To
____________________ FRED L ALLEN [11-381]
Siget Apt N C/O SYLVIA ALLEN
i Siaie; 2P PO BOX 271

CASSANOVA, VA 22017

PS Form 3800. A

U.S. Postal Service -
CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

7009 2250 0003 8599 8Dk?

7009 2250 0OD0O3 8599 8050

Postage

0

Certified Fee

2.8

Retumn Receipt Fee
(Endorsement Required)

z2-30

Restricted Delivery Fee
(Endorsement Required)

Total Postage & Fees

Sent To

City, State, ZiP+d

PS Form 3800. A

U.S. Postal Servicew

§ 557

RICHARD FETT [11-381]
115 W BLOUNT ST
PENSACOLA, FL 32501

CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT -

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)

e e
g««@g .

For delivery information visit our website at www.u

ICITAL

Sps.comg

Postage

R

Certified Fee

-8

Return Receipt Fee
(Endorsement Required)

Z 30

Restricted Delivery Fee
(Endorsement Required)

Total Postage & Fees

Sent To

City, Siate, ZiP+d

$45-59 |

GLASS LIVING TRUST [11-381]

5510 GLASS DR. LOT 5
PENSACOLA, FL 32505

PS Form 3800. A

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)

Total Postage & Fees

Sent To

City, State, ZiP+

PS Form 3800. 4

557 |

DANIEL GLOWA [11-381]
1779 BRIDGE PORT COLONY LANE
FT WALTON BEACH, FL 32547

=
r\- " s .
[} nformation visit our website at www.usps.
@0 - ; .
- FFICIAI
E Postage | $ 0 ¢ 4‘/
0 -
Certified Fee 2. ‘? J’I
L Return Receipt Fee
eturn Receip

g (Endorsement Required) 2 . 5 0
= Restricted Delivery Fee

(Endorsement Required)
Qa
LN
n
n
o
a
0
-
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® Compilete items 1, 2, and 3. Also compiste
item 4 if Restricted Delivery Is desired.

® Print your name and address on the reverse
so that we can return the card to you.

* W Attach this card to the back of the malipiecs,

or on the front if space permits.

COMPLET™ THIS SECTIGN ON DELIVE

[RHAddresses
C. Date of Delivery
£/3/ 7/

; 1. Article Addressed to:

JLSC PROPERTIES LLC [11-381]
229 SABINE DR
PENSACOLA BEACH, FL 32561

address different from item 12 L1 Yes
entor delivery address below: - [ No

3. Type
E Certified Mail [ Express Mail
Registered ] Retum Recelpt for Merchandise
Ol insured Mall 3 C.0.D.

4, RestrlctedDdIvely?(E‘thee)

0 Yes

2. Article Number

(Waneter fom service label) ~ 7009 2250 D003 8539 8081

PS Form 3811, February 2004

"PLETE THIS SECTION

| items 1, 2, and 3. Also complete
item 4 if Restricted Delivery is desired. X 0 Agent
M Print your name and address on the reverse S Z4 ] Addressee
so that we can return the card to you. y
 Aftach this card o the back of the malliecs, || - Py (Pred Nems) . vy el
or on the front if space permits. ke
- D. Is delivery address different from item 12 fes
1. Article Addressed to: I YES, enter delivery address below: L1 No
GLASS LIVING TRUST [11-381]
5510 GLASS DR. LOT 5 3.  Type
PENSACOLA, FL 32505 g(‘::ngml LT Express Mail
Registered [J Return Receipt for Merchandise
O insured Mail [ C.O.D.
4. Restricted Delivery? (Extra Fes) [ Yes
2. Article Number I -
(Tranefer from service label) 7009 EESU DDD3 8599 BUSD
PS Form 3811, February 2004 Domestic Return Receipt 10R905-00-04-1540
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"E THIS SECTION

B Compilete items 1, 2, and 3. Also complete

item 4 if Restricted Delivery is desired.

@ Print your name and address on the reverse
so that we can return the card to you.

W Attach this card to the back of the mailpiece,

or on the front if space permits.

COMPLETE THIS SECTION ON Dt

A
BW) C. Date,of Delivery
g ' (@[

1. Article Addressed to:

FRED L ALLEN [11-381]
C/O SYLVIA ALLEN
PO BOX 271
CASSANOVA, VA 22017

D. s delivery address different from item 12 [ Yes
I YES, enter delivery address below: [ No

3 Type
gcmiﬁedMail [ Express Mail
Registered DRetumReoelptforMevchandlse
[ Insured Mail c.oD.
4. Restricted Delivery? (Extra Fee) O Yes

2. Article Number T
(Transfer from service labei)

2009 2250 0003 8599 8043

PS Form 3811, February 2004

{1 JER: COMPLETE THIS SECTION

B Complete items 1, 2, and 3. Also complete
Ihun4ifRestrictedDeliverylsdesimd
# Print your name and address on the reverse
so that we can return the card to you.
lAttachthlscardtothebackofthemailplece
or on the front if space permits.

Domestic Return Recelpt

102595-02--1840

COMPLETE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY

A. : p
T Vi gz
eceived by ( Pril Name) C. of Delivery
mwga (oot -5/

1. Article Addressed to:

DANIEL GLOWA [11-381]
1779 BRIDGE PORT COLONY LANE
FT WALTON BEACH, FL 32547

D. Is delivery address different from item 1? I Yes .
If YES, enter delivery address below: 1 No

3. Service Type
Certified Mall  [J Express Mail
Registered ] Retum Receipt for Merchandise
O InsuredMait 1 C.OD.
4. Restricted Delivery? (Extta Feg) O Yes

2. Adticie Number
(Tranefer from service jabel)

7009 2250 D003 A599 8074

PS Form 3811, February 2004

Domestic Return Receipt

102905-02-M-1540
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ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
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BRANCH OFFICES
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ECPAMAP{00-05-00

BdeoBE

112-071) - Microsoft Internet Explorer provided by Ernie L e Magaha
0 ; o — -

Copy Map Image Map Layers

[ use numeric selection labels Record Search
Download Selection Data (1 row)

Reference: 00-05-00-9010-112-071
Account: 13-1595-000
Section Map: CA094 )
Situs: 500 W DESOTO ST BLK
Subdivision:
BELMONT TRACT
Owner: ALLEN FRED L
Mailing Address:
C/O SYLVIA ALLEN
PO BOX 271
CASSANOVA, VA 22017
Last Sale: n/a, $0
Property Use: VACANT RESIDENTIAL
Approx. Acreage: 0.0800
Building Count: 0
Total Heated Area: 0
Zoned: R-1A

@’V}”’Zi . X, Print Tool
—F = ,

J
P

WDESOTO 5T

[T Include radius in selection {5280 ft max)
o
Radius is used only with single parcel selection

[Ca ot
Reference Nbr uto Sele

Lookup Results

JEx: 012N334444555666

Tuesday, May 17, 2011 09:27 AM




WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON July 5,
2011, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793. 2

s r_P,,

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEE-D

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA holder of Tax G{&iﬁcate No.
08081, issued the 30th day of May, A.D., 2008 has filed same in my office and has made,appdmatloﬁfor a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certlﬁcate embraces the following described property-in @ Coun/.ty of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit: —i = _{

E 64/10 FT OF LT 11 AND W 17 4/10 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK 71 BELMONT TRKT'}T;CA %Q
—

NOr 1102

]

TENRVERER

SECTION 00, TOWNSHIP 0 S, RANGE 00 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 131595000 (11-381)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
FRED L ALLEN

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 AM. on the first Tuesday in the month of July, which is the
Sth day of July 2011.

Dated this 2nd day of June 2011.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Post Property: ) o
| 500 W DESOTO ST BLK 32501]  By:

Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk




co ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

NON-ENFORCEABLE RETURN OF SERVICE

Document Number: ECSO11CIV027883NON Agency Numisr 1010835
Court: TAX DEED

County: ESCAMBIA

Case Number: CERT # 08081, 2003

AttomeyfAgent:

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA,
CLERK OF THE COURT
TAX DEEDS

Plaintiff:  IN RE FRED L ALLEN
Defendant:

Type of Process: NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR Tax DEED

.,
"

Received this Writ on. 8/2/2011 at 10:28 aAM and sarced same at 200 &bt gn §020 1 in ESC MBS COUNTY,
FLORIDA, by serving POST PRGPERTY |, the within named, to it |

POSTED TO PROPERTY PER CLERKS INSTRUCTIZNS

Service Fos,
Receipt Mo

Printed By LCWITCHE




ERNIE LEE MAGAHA NS e BRANCH OFFICES

ARCHIVES AND RECORDS

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT JUVENILE DIVISION

CENTURY
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILD SUPPORT
CIRCUIT CIVIL
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL
COUNTY CIVIL
COUNTY CRIMINAL CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
DOMESTIC RELATIONS COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FAMILY LAW COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA
JURY ASSEMBLY OFFICIAL RECORDS
JUVENILE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY TREASURY
MENTAL HEALTH AUDITOR
MIS CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE
TRAFFIC

IMAGING COVER PAGE

This cover page is not a part of the original documents but is
necessary to avoid obscuring any information on
the original documents

Case: 2008 TD 008081

O A

00093363974
Dkt: TD84 Pgi:

Original Documents Follow
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ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILD SUPPORT
CIRCUIT CIVIL
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL
COUNTY CIVIL
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW
JURY ASSEMBLY
JUVENILE
MENTAL HEALTH
MIS
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
PROBATE
TRAFFIC

BRANCH OFFICES
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
JUVENILE DIVISION

CENTURY

CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA o
OFFICE OF THE &Z‘%ﬁ%‘é@ﬁ%ﬁ
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

IMAGING COVER PAGE

This cover page is not a part of the original documents but is
necessary to avoid obscuring any information on
the original documents

08 TD 008081

Case: 20
0 G 0 O

00058541169
Dkt: TD84 Pgit:

Original Documents Follow




Chris Jones

Escambia County Property Appraiser

[Real Estate Search || Tangible Property Search || Amendment 1 Calculations

Back

[E Navigate Mode & Account
 Reference

Reference: 0005009010112071 Improvemaents: $0
Account: 131595000 Land: $8,479
Owners: ALLEN FRED L e
Mail: C/O SYLVIA ALLEN Total: $8,479
PO BOX 271 .
CASSANOVA, VA 22017 =ave Qur. Homes. 30
Situs: 500 W DESOTO ST BLK 32501 Disclaimer
Use Code: VACANT RESIDENTIAL -
Taxing Amendment 1 Calculations
Authority: PENSACOLA CITY LIMITS
Tax Inquiry:  Open Tax Inguiry Window

Official Records

Sale Date Book Page Value Type (New Window)

None
E64/10FTOFLT 11 AND W 17
4710 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK
71 BELMONT TRACT...

Section Map
1d:
CAQ94

APProx.
Acreage:
0.0800

Zoned:

R-1A




Page 1 of 1

G

Print Date:
3/30/2011 11:36:50
Transaction #: 849857 AM
» Receipt #: 201116630
ERNIE LEE MAGAHA Cashier Date: 3/30/2011 11:36:50 AM
Clerk of the Circuit Court (BROBINSON)
Escambia County, FL
P.O. Box 333
Pensacola, FL 32591

830-595-3930

DateReceived: 03/30/2011
Over the

(TXD) TAX DEED DIVISION Source Code:y e
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT Q Code: Total Fees $390.00
221 PALAFOX PLACE Return Code: Government Total Payments $390.00
Pensacola, FL. 32502 Trans Type: Recording

Agent Ref

Num:

$390.00

Q (MISCFEE) MISCELLANEOQUS FEES

TX CERT 08081 OF 2008

TAXCR 330 $330.00
TAXCT 1 $60.00

file://C:\Program F iles\RecordingModule\default. htm 3/30/2011




Ernie Lee Magaha,
Clerk of the Circuit Court of Escambia County PFlorida

Receipt Type Case Cutstanding Aawnocunt 0.00
YP 3

Receipt Number 1269128 Receipt Date 03/30/2011

Cage Number 2008 Th 008081

Desgcription ESCAMBIA COURTY VS

Action TAX DEED APPLICATION
Judge
Received From BOCC ESCAMBIA COUNTY

On Behalf Of ESCAMBIA COUNTY

Total Received 390.00

Net Received 390.00
Change 0.00

Receipt Payments Amount Reference Description
Cash 3%90.00
Receipt Applications Amount
Bolding 330.00
Service Charge 60.00
Digsbursement Accounts Amount
DEPOSITS - TAX DEEDS 330.00
TAX DEED CERTIFICATE 60.00
CLERKS FEE
Deputy Clerk: bbr Transaction Date 83/30/2011 15:87:04

Comments




S

FIND A PERSON

CASSANOVA

(|38

Add ta Address Book | Print Find more Info

Fred L Allen
More informatic
Po Box 271, Casanova, VA 20138
540-788-8342 » Fmail at
Find Fre
Are you Fred L Alien? » Remove Listing Information provided solety by intelius Number
» Get Det
. . RunabB
Get Directions
» Verfy P
Does Fr

» View Pr

“Enter Address
What is

» \iew S¢
Find Fre

- Pg Box 271, Casanova, VA 20139

» Get Cor
Find Fre

» Reverse Directions

Find Nearby Bt

Attorneys

Auto Dealers
Beauty Salons
Dentists
5 Fiorists
(%a' Hotels
[+ e
Vaisﬂﬁ‘w’am

g
Qgg’ : © 2010 Microsoft Corporation D 2010 NAVIEG B AND

public records may be found for Fred Allen with current & verified Phone & Address

Foedback |




CASSANOVA

[[-58]

SYLVIA

Porsonal identifying information avaﬁasie t;;z YR .comis ot 'sgea- oy ATST andis ;pﬁ’}, e{& solsly by an usiatiiated third party, mt’éii‘:}s. e, Fult Disclatmer

Sylvia E Allen | Add to Address Book | Print Find more Info

re infc i
271 Rr 747, Casanova, VA 20138 More in ormatic

540-7188-9342 » Email at

Find Syl
Number

Ate you Syfvia E Aflen? » Remove Listing information provided solely by intelius

» Get Det
Runab

Get Directions

» Verify P
Does &)
records’

» View Pr:
what is

» View SC
Find Syt

» Get Cor
Find Sy

» Reverse Directions

Find Nearby Bt

Attorneys
Agto Dealers
Beauty Salons
Dentists
Florists
Hotels

© 2010 Microsoft C

public records may be found for Sylvia Alien with current & verified Phone & Address

Fée{iik;ééi{ 4 _




e o vt 8 WA

o Snbsets

Enter an individual or business
CIALER () : name like "Sparks Shelton”. Leave
ClaUENsLVAM (1) 5 commay out. Name must be at
least 3 characters long.

Tuesday, Jun 28, 2011 0410 PM




# Check Qut

‘m;EN {105}

[JAUENFRED (13
CIALENFREDH (21
CIALENFREDHIR (22
CJALLENFREDH SR (6]

[ISLLEN FRED HAROLD 1)
LJALLEN FRED HAROLD SR {7)
[JALLENFREDK 11}
[JALLENFREDAN {1}

~[JALLEN FRERERICKE {1}
~LJALER FREDERICKER  (3)

- JSLLEN FREDERICKE SR (14
LJALLENFREDEMCK EARL {3
[IALLEN FREDERICK EARL W {2}
~{CJALLEN FREDERICK KRISTIAN - (8)
L. [TJALLEN FHEDRICK (1)

Enter an individual or business
name like "Sparks Shelton”. Leave
commas out. Mame must be at
teast 3 characters long.

Tuesday. Jun 28, 2011 04:15 PM




ERNIE LEE MAGAHA

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDRSUPPORT BRANCR QFF!CES
CIRCUIT QIVR. ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCULT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE OFFICIAL RECORDS
MENTAL HEALTH COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
MIs OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
O SERVICES CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC
Case # 2008 TD 008081
Sold Date 07/05/2011
Name NO BID
I} RegistryOfCourtT = TAXDEED 0
[} overbidamount = TAXDEED $0.00
[ PostageT = TD2 $30.00
I Researcher Copies = TD6 $5.00
[Tt prepFee=TD4 $14.00
I advdocstampsdeed = TAXDEED | $21.70
f“‘ advancerecording = TAXDEED $20.50
It AdvRecordingDeedT = TAXDEED $10.00

Date | Docket |

05/3072008 1D

05/30/2008 TAXDEED .

09/05/2011]  TDE3 TAX COLLECTOR CERTIFICATION 0.00 0.00

04/21/2011]  TORZ O & £ REPORT nik 0.00 0.00

06/01/2011]  TDBI CERTIFICATE OF MAILING 0.00 0.00

06/00/2011]  TDB4 CORRESPONDENCE (certified mafing recispts) nik 0.00 0.00

06/10/2011]  TD84 CORRESPONDENCE (green cards) nik 0.00 0.00

06/14/2011] 084 CORRESPONDENCE(green cordsimva 0.00 0.00

ESCAMBIA

Sun

06/24/201 L] TAXDEEDPAY PAYMENT TAX DEEDS 210,00 0.00  |PRESS - p
0 BOX
4625

RRESPONDENCE(RETURNED CERTIFIED MAIL FROM RICHA
06/28/2011  TDB4 o CE( Fﬁ_.mWA OM RICHARD 0.00 0.00

# et fHamissed
$60.00 $60.00 $0.00 $0.00
$330.00 $330.00 $0.00 $0.00
~ TOTAL $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $°f_°J

fl




ERNIE LEE MAGAHA

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUIT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY K COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE OFFICIAL RECORDS
MemAégmm COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
OPERATIONAL SERVICES CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC
ERNIE LEE MAGAHA, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT Cash Summa
No Bid Tax.Deed Sale = -
Cash Deposit | $0.00
Cert # 008081 of 2008 Date 07/05/2011 é"ta’gwj gig; '223
Name NO BID rang Tota '
Purchase Price $3,019.40 Opening Bid Amount $3,019.40 OverBid Amount $0.00
Total Check $101.20
Adv Recording Deed  $10.00
Adv Doc. Stamps $521.70
Postage $30.00
Researcher Copies $5.00
Adv Recording Mail Cert  $20.50
Clerk’s Prep Fee £14.00
Sheriff Services over $60 0
Legal Ad over $168 0
Total Extra TD Registry of Court Fees ¢

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
Clerk of the Circuit Court

By:
Deputy Clerk

Escambia County Government Complex * 221 Palafox Place Ste 110 » PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
(859) 595-3793 «» FAX (850) 595-4827 + http://www.clerk.co.escambia. fl.us




ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUIT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUTT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVERILE OFFICIAL RECORDS
MENTAL };EALTH : COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
g : OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
OPERATIONAL SERVICES CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC
ERNIE LEE MAG:;:AB:‘ §§Eal:l( QF T!s-i; eCIRC&!I‘I’ COURT Cash Summa
¥ Deed Cash Deposit  1$0.00
Cert # 008081 of 2008 Date 07/05/2011 g‘m dc?j:;; éigi '38
Name NO BID ran .
ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
Clerk of the Circuit Court
By:
Deputy Clerk
Escambia County Government Complex » 221 Palafox Place Ste 110 * PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
(850) 595-3793 » FAX (850) 595-4827 » http:/fwww.clerk.co.escambia.fl.us




Bankruptcy Party Sesrch

> Case Locator

Mon Jun 27 12:49:04 2011 / 38|
5 records found /
User: ec0724
Client: .
Search: Bankruptcy Party Search Name allen, fred Virginia Page: 1

1 Allen, Fred O., il (db) vaebke 3:11-bk-32826 13 04/27/2011

Fred O. Allen and Delois Tibbs Allen
2 Allen, Fred Oliver, IV (jdb) vaebke3:11-bk-30102 7 01/07/2011 04/29/2011 Standard Discharge

04/25/2011
Ashley C. Smith-Allen and Fred Oliver Allen
3 Allen, Freda Maria (db) vaebke4:05-bk-52316 7 08/02/2005 12/26/2005 Standard Discharge
12/19/2005

Freda Maria Allen

4 Allen, Frederick Andrew, Jr.  vaebke4:92-bk-41735 7 08/24/1992 01/05/1993 Standard Discharge
(db) 12/09/1992
Frederick Andrew Allen and Judy Christine Allen

5 Allen, Frederick Clarence, Jr  vaebke2:89-bk-23468 7 09/14/1989 10/24/1990 Standard Discharge
(db)
Frederick Clarence Allen and Mary Lougenia Allen

PACER Sarvice Cerntar Recolpt 08/27/2011 12:49:04 47436402
User ec0724 R

Clignt
Description Bankrupicy Parly Search o
Name alien, fred Virginia Page: 1 = .
Pages 1{50.08} '
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ERNTE LEE MAGAHA

CLHERG OF THE CIUUITCOURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
(SEALY
By Maryline Avils
Deputy Clerk:

w5391 T304

gy i e

PUBLISHED WEEKLY SINCE 1948

(Warrington) Pensacola, Escambia County, Florida

STATE OF FLORIDA

County of Escambia

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared
Michael J. Driver

who is personally known to me and who on oath says that he is
Publisher of The Escambia Sun Press, a weekly newspaper
published at (Warrington) Pensacola in Escambia County,
F!ogg%-tctléat the attached copy of a(leEI‘éisement, being a

in the matter of
DATE:: 0:/00/2011 - TAX ChRL #:08U81

in the CIRCUIT Court

was %ublished in said newspaper in the issues of
JUNE 2, 9, 16, 23, 2011

Affiant further says that the said Escambia Sun-Press is a
newspaper published at (W arrington) Pensacola, in said
Escambia County, Florida, and that the said newspager has
heretofore been continnously published in said Escambia County,
Florida each week and has been entered as second class mail
matter at the post office in Pensacola, in said Escambia County,
Florida, for a period of one year next preceding the first

ublication of the attached copy of advertisement; and affiant
urther says that he has neither paid nor promised any person,
firm or corporation any discount, rebate, commission or refund
for the purpose of securing this advertisement for publication in

- W/
/

/ PUBLISHER
Sworn to and subscribed before me this 23"
day of _JUNE AD.,20 -
DENISE G. TURNER NOTARY PUBLIC

WY DENISE 6. TURNER
f ,;z’l‘%; Notary Public-State of Florids
z\% Comm, Exp. Aug. 24, 2012
vE8IF  Comm. Neo. DD 791837




Pam Childers

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY FLORIDA

NSTE 2014047454 07/07/2014 at 03:44 PM

OFF REC BK: 7192 PG 963 - 9683 Doc Type. D

DEED
ESCHEATED

This instrument was prepared by:

STATE OF FLORIDA Pam Childers, Clerk of the Circuit Court
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA Escambia County Courthouse
Pensacola, Florida

WHEREAS, Tax Certitication No, 03081 was issued on May 30, 2008, against the 1and described hercin-below, and the Tax

Collector of Escambia County, Florida, duly delivered to the Clerk of the Circuit Court of said County a certificate as required by law as
4 as required by law, and no person entitled so

to the application for a Tax Deed thereon, and due notice of sale was published and maile
to do appeared to redeem said Tand, and said land was, on the Sth day of July, 2011, offered for public sale as required by law, and there
being no bidders at the public sale, the fand was entered on the list of "Lands Available for Taxes” and notice thereof sent to the County
Commission and any other persons holding centificates against said land as required by law, and no person of governtental unit having
purchased said land, and fhree years having elupsed since the land was offered for public sale, the land has escheated to Escambia

County,Florida, pursuant to Section 197.502(8), Florida Statutes; and

WHEREAS, Section 197.302(8), Florida Statutes, directs the Clerk of the Circuit Court to now execute a tax deed vesting title in
the Board of County Commissioners of Escambia County, Florida;

NOW, THEREFORE, KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that 1, the undersigned Clerk, for Escambia County,
Florida, in consideration of these premises, and pursusnt o Section 197.502(8), Florida Statutes, do hereby release, remise, quitciaim,
and convey to the Escambia County Board of County Conmissieners, 271 Patafox Place , Pensacola, Florida, 32507, their SUcCcessors

and assigns, forever, the following described land in Recambia County, Florida, to wit:
F 6 4/10 FT OF LT 11 AND w l’_7 44106 FT OF LT 12 BEL NO BLK 71 BELMONT TRACTCA %4

SECTION 00, TOWNSHIP 0 SOUTH, RANGE 00 WEST
REFERENCE NUMBER 0005009010112071
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 131595000

*+ Property previously assessed to: FRED L ALLEN
Together with sl and singular the tenements, hereditaments, and appurienances, thereto helonging or in anywise appertaining.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, by virtue of authority in me vested by law, and for and on behaif of Escambia, County, Florida,

as Clerk of the Circuit Court of said Couaty, 1 have executed this deed and have hereunto set my official seal this

PAM CHILDERS,
Clerk of the Circuit Court
Escambia County, Florida

WITNESSES: SRR
; SURRCL
o e b

TEEES
eatbiug,

o fe, Sy
- ) 5
e SR

x‘«%‘.c

(OFFICIAL SEAL)

&

State of Florida
County of Escambia

Before me, the undersigned, personally appeared PAM CHILDERS, to me well known and known to me to be the individual
described by that name who executed the foregoing instrument, and also known to e to be the Clerk of the Circuit Court of Escambia
County, Florida, who acknowledged that he executed the same as Clerk of the uses and purposes therein set forth, and as the act and

deed of said County.

GIVEN under my hand and official seal this day of July, 2014,

@Childe Clevk of the Cireunit Lourt

LAA ‘ 5 e
i1y Hogg, Depysy Clogk ¥~ @ {3:3? *« f‘?ic 'S g,?
R et
"’,«.""4 GG‘\}“‘$“

Rl 0% Tl

day of July, 2614,




