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FORM 513

;Appltication

(r12000 TAX COLLECTOR'S CERTIFICATION ~ Date/Number
May 25, 2012 /120574

This is to certify that the holder listed below of Tax Sale Certificate Number 2005 / 5506 , issued the .

1st day of June, 2005, and which encumbers the following described property located in the County of Escambla State of

Florida to wit: Parcel ID Number: 12-2848-000

Certificate Holder: Property Owner:

DOCKERY DENZEL J ORRUTH E SIGAFOOSE J BOYD & JUDITH P
5755 DAVID BLVD 3650 OAK SHADE RD

PORT CHARLOTTE, FLORIDA 33981 CENTURY , FLORIDA 32535

Legal Description: 07-5N3-243

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB OR 3035 P 685

has surrendered same in my office and made written application for tax deed in accordance with Florida Statutes [ certify
that the following tax certificates, interest, ownership and encumbrance report fee, and Tax Collectors fees have been paid:

" CERTIFICATES OWNED BY APPLICANT AND FILED IN CONNECTION WITH THIS TAX DEED APPLICATION: '

Cert. Year | Certificate Number Date of Sale Face Amt TIC Fee Interest Total
2005 | 5506 06/01/05 $51.49 $0.00 $64.88 $116.37
CERTIFICATES REDEEMED BY APPLICANT OR INCLUDED (COUNTY) IN CONNECTION WITH THIS APPLICATION: .
Cert. Year | Certificate Number Date of Sale Face Amt T/C Fee Interest Total
2011 10251.0000 06/01/11 $57.99 $6.25 $10.44 $74.68
2010 10648 06/01/10 $52.99 $6.25 : $19.08 - $78.32
2009 9934 06/01/09 $52.21 $6.25 , $28.20 $86.66
2008  |7838 05/30/08 $46.10 $6.25 o $33.88 | - $86.23
2007 6497 06/01/07 $50.60 $6.25 $45.54 | $102.39
2006 8142 06/01/06 $37.00 $6.25 $39.96 $83.21
1. Total of all Certificates in Applicant's Possession and Cost of the Certificates Redeemed by
Applicant or Included (County) , $627.86
2. Total of Delinquent Taxes Paid by Tax Deed Application $0.00
3. Total of Current Taxes Paid by Tax Deed Applicant (2011) .. $64.54
4. Ownership and Encumbrance Report Fee < $150.00
5. Tax Deed Application Fee $75.00
6. Total Certified by Tax Collector to Clerk of Court $917.40
7. Clerk of Court Statutory Fee
8. Clerk of Court Certified Mail Charge
9. Clerk of Court Advertising Charge
10. Sheriff's Fee
1. :
12. Total of Lines 6 thru 11 $917.40
13. Interest Computed by Clerk of Court Per Florida Statutes.....( %) :
14. One-Half of the assessed value of homestead property. If applicable pursuant to section
197.502, F.S.
15. Statutory (Opening) Bid; Total of Lines 12 thru 14
16. Redemption Fee $6.25

17. Total Amount to Redeem

*Done this 25th day of May, 2012

R, ESCAMBIA COUNTY, ELORIDA

Date of Sale: %MM 7 L0 3

= MW 5

* This certiﬁcatronédst be surrendered to the Clerk of the Circuit Court no later than ten days after thlS date




DR-512

R.05/88 Application Number: 120574

Notice to Tax Collector of Application for Tax Deed

TO: Tax Collector of Escambia County

In accordance with Florida Statutes, I, DOCKERY DENZEL J OR RUTH E

5755 DAVID BLVD ‘

PORT CHARLOTTE, Florida, 33981 -
holder of the following tax sale certificate hereby surrender same to the Tax Collector and make tax
deed application thereon: Co ‘

Certificate No. Parcel ID Number Date Legal Description

5506 12-2848-000 06/01/2005 07-5N3-243 '
BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46
YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB OR
3035 P 685 ‘ ‘

T
SIGAFOOSE J BOYD & JUDITH P
3650 OAK SHADE RD
CENTURY , Florida 32535

I agree to pay all delinquent taxes, redeem all outstanding certificates not in my possession, pay any
omitted taxes, and pay current taxes, if due, covering the land, and pay any interest earned (a) on tax certificates
not in my possession, (b) on omitted taxes or (c) on delinquent taxes. I also agree to pay all Tax Collector's fees,
ownership and encumbrance reports costs, Clerk of the Court costs, charges and fees and Sheriff's costs, if
applicable. Attached is the above-mentioned tax sale certificate on which this application is based and all other
certificates of the same legal description which are in my possession.

docdockery (Denzel Dockery) A P 05/’25/2012
Applicant's Signature . Date
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e Southern Guaranty Title Company
4400 Bayou Boulevard, Suite 13B
Pensacola, Florida 32503
Telephone: 850-478-8121
Facsimile: 850-476-1437
OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
File No.: 9562 July 19, 2012

Escambia County Tax Collector
P.O. Box 1312
Pensacola, Florida 32569

Pursuant to your request, the Company has caused a search to be made of the Public Records of Escambia
County, Florida, solely as revealed by records maintained from 07-19-1992, through 07-19-2012, and said
search reveals the following:
1. THE GRANTEE(S) OF THE LAST DEED(S) OF RECORD IS:

J. Boyd Sigafoose and Judith P. Sigafoose, husband and wife

2. The land covered by this Report is:
LEGAL DESCRIPTION IS ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

3. The following unsatisfied mortgages, liens and judgments affecting the land covered by this Report
appear of record:

SEE CONTINUATION PAGE ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

4. Taxes:
SEE CONTINUATION PAGE ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF

The foregoing report is prepared and furnished for information only, is not intended to constitute or imply any
opinion, warranty, guaranty, insurance, or similar assurance as to the status of title, and no determination has
been made of the authenticity of any instrument described or referred to herein. The name search for the
purposes of determining applicable judgments and liens is limited to the apparent record owner(s) shown herein,
No attempt has been made to determine whether the land is subject to liens or assessments which are not shown
as existing liens by the public records. The Company's liability hereunder shall not exceed the cost of this
Report, or $1,000.00 whichever is less.

THIS REPORT SHALL NOT BE USED FOR THE ISSUANCE OF TITLE INSURANCE.

Southern Guaranty Title Compan

July 19, 2012




OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

File No.: 9562 July 19, 2012

075N324301000000 - Full Legal Description

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO
POB OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542



OWNERSHIP AND ENCUMBRANCE REPORT
CONTINUATION PAGE

File No.: 9562 | July 19, 2012

UNSATISFIED MORTGAGES, LIENS AND JUDGMENTS AFFECTING THE LAND COVERED BY THIS
REPORT THAT APPEAR OF RECORD:

1. Taxes for the year 2004-2011 delinquent. The assessed value is $1,824.00. Tax ID
12-2848-000.

PLEASE NOTE THE FOLLOWING:

Taxes and assessments due now or in subsequent years.

Subject to Easements, Restrictions and Covenants of record.

Oil, gas, mineral or any other subsurface rights of any kind or nature.

Encroachments, overlaps, boundary line disputes, and any other matters which would be
disclosed by an accurate survey and inspection of the premises.

SCowp



' SOUTHERN GUARANTY TITLE CGW‘&N’Y

4400 BAYOU BLVD., SUITE 13-B, CORDCVA SQUARE
PEN\ACCﬂJ&TﬁCﬂ{EIQDQib
TEL. (850) 4788121  FAX (850)476-1437
' Fmail: resgt@aol.com

Janet Holley
Escambia County Tax C071ector

P.0. Box 1312
,PmsacoWa, TL 32596

CERTTFICATION: TITLE SEARCH FOR TDA

TAX DEED SALE DATE: 1-7-2013

TAX ACCOUN‘Z“ NO. : 12-2848-000

CERTIFICATE NO.: 2005-5506

In compliance with Section 197.256, Tlorida Statutes, the

followin

is a list of nzmes and addresses of +hose persons, firms and/or

agencies having legal interest in or claim agains

+ the above

described property. The above referenced taxX sale certificate is
being submitted as proper notification of tax deed szle.

YES NO

.X Notify City of Pensacola, P.0. Box 12910, 32521

X

Homestead for . tax vear.

————

J. Boyd Sigafoose
Judith P. Sigafoose
3650 Oak Shade Rd.
Century, FL 32535

Certified and delivered to Escambia County TaxX Collector,

this 24th day of _July C 2012'-

SOUTnJ_ GUARANTY TITLE PENY

By: R+€ha*d S. Combs, President

NOTE: The above listed addresses are.based upon current
zvzilzhle, but said addresses are not guarantead

9]

it

Notify Escambia County, 190 Governmen;a* Center, 32502



Recorded in Public Records 06/14/2006 at 01:40 PM OR Book 5928 Page 542,

Instrument #2006060256,
County, FL Recording $44.00 Deed Stamps $0.70

¢

.

Ernie Lee Magaha Clerk of the Circuit Court Escambia

This Instrument Prepared by:

William E. Farrington, 11,

Wilson, Harrell, Farrington & Ford, P.A.
307 S. Palafox Street

Pensacola, FL 32502

PARCEL ID #'s 025N323300000000 115N322101000000
025N322221000000 . 115N322230000000
025N323100000000 025N323100000002
025N324230000000 075N324301000000

WARRANTY DEED

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, That J. BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P.
SIGAFOOSE, husband and wife, Grantors, for and in consideration of the sum of Ten Dollars ($10.00) cash
in hand paid, and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt whereof is hereby acknowledged, do
hereby grant, bargain, sell, convey and warrant unto J. BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P. SIGAFOOSE,
husband and wife, whose address is 3650 Oak Shade Road,Century, Florida 32535, Grantees, Grantees' heirs,
executors, administrators and assigns, forever, the following described property, situated in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to-wit: :

SEE ATTACHED EXHIBIT “A”

This Deed is being executed and recorded for the purpose of creating a tenancy by the
entireties between the Grantees, as to the real properties described on the attached
Exhibit “A”, : :

TITLES TO THE ABOVE-DESCRIBED PROPERTIES WERE NEITHER
EXAMINED NOR APPROVED BY THE PREPARER OF THIS INSTRUMENT.

And the Grantor does hereby fully warrant the title to said land and will defend the same against lawful claims
of all persons whomsoever. Subject to taxes for current year and to valid easements and restrictions of record
affecting the above property, if any, which are not hereby reimposed. Subject also to oil, gas and mineral
reservations of record.

\ N WITNESS WHEREOF, we have hereunto set our hands and seals this / 5 " day of
S , 2006,

Signed, Sealed and Delivered in

(SEAL)




BK: 5928 PG: 543

STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

Acknowledged before me this jl; day of 3{‘*‘/&’ , 2006, personally appeared

J. BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P. SIGAFOOSE, wio are personally kn
DL S3a 422 00374 identification and who did not t e an oath,

FL DL SHAFas4oSHeD

mission DDA78865
NEF e o009

‘Notary Public State of Florida
!? Angela E Bonds
!

own to me or who produced

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA
My Commission Expires: Novemberis-2066-
My Commission Number: BB146973—



BK:

5928 PG: 544

PARCEL A

~—Daginning ax the Soythwest Copuvr of the Suuthe .. . .o
——Yest Quartec (SK}) of Saction 2. Tomnsbip b meee
~-North, Ra memw._
line 344 feet; theace run North paralie} with the
West Quarter lize 452 feet; ;hgggg_;un_!gg;_jji_jgnﬁ___.

beginntag. Said plot containing 3 1/2 acras more
or_leas. -and' {3 BB

Less and except, that certain portion as described in that
certain Warranty Deed dated June 12, 2000, and recorded in
Official Record Book 4572, Pages 0715-0717 of the Public
Records of Escambia County, Florida. :

PARCEL B

The Southwest Quarter of the Northwest Quarter (SW 1/4 of NW 1/4) LESS AND
EXCEPT the following: Commencing at the Southwest Corner of the Southwest
Quarter of the Northwest Quarter (SW Cor. of SW 1/4 of NW 1/4) of Section 2,
Township 5 North, Range 32 West, Escambia County, Florida, thence North along
the West line of said Section a distance of 554 feet to the point of beginning; thence
continue 208,71 feet; thence East 208.71 feet; thence South 208.71 feet; thence
West 208,71 feet to the point of beginning, containing one (1) acre, more or less;
ALSO LESS AND EXCEPT the following: Commence at the Southwest Corner
of the Southwest Quarter of the Northwest Quarter (SW Cor. of SW 1/4 of NW
174 of Section 2, Township 5 North, Range 32 Wesi, Escambia County, Florida;
thence North along the West line of Section 712.71 feet; thence East 208.71 feet
to the point of beginning; thence continue East 60 feet; thence North 174.72 fect;
thence North 28 degrees 23 minutes West a distance of 85.59 feet; thence West
17.09 feet; thence South 250 feet back to the point of beginning.

The East 110 yards of the South 220 yards of the Northwest Quarter of the
Northwest Quarter (NW 1/4 of NW 1/4), all of said property being located in
Section 2, Township 5 North, Range 32 West, Escambia County, Florida.

Less and except, that certain portion as described in
that certain Warranty Deed dated August 16, 2002, and

recorded in Official Record Book 4958, Pages 1817-1818
of the Public Records of Escambia County, Florida; and

Also less and except, that certain portion as described
in that certain Corrective Quit. Claim-Deed dated
September 29, 2003, and recorded in Official Record
Book 5332, Pages 0853-0855 of the Public Records of
Escambia County, Florida. .

EXHIBIT "A"



BK:

5928 PG:

545

PARCEL C

North West quarter of North West quarter; North East quarter of ﬂnﬂh West guarter; North We's;_ ,
quaster of North East quarter ail located in Section 11 of Township 5, North Range 32 West, less
Garrett property as recorded in OR 2554 at page 168. o :

South West Quarter of South West Quarter; North East Quarter of South West Quarter; South
East Quarter of South West Quarter; The West Half of South West Quarter of South East
Quarter; West Half of North. West Quarter of South East Quarter; North East Quarter of South
West Quarter of South East Quarter; all in Section 2, Township 5 North Range 32 West, LESS

AND EXCEPT that property described in OR 385 at page 645.

Also less and except, that certain portiom described.in that certain
Warranty Deed dated May 10, 1988, and recorded in Official Record

Book 2554, Pages 168-169 of the Public Records of Escambia County, =

Florida; and

Also less and except, that certain portion described in that certain
Special Warranty Deed dated July 29, 1999, and recorded in Official
Record Book 4448 Pages 0394-0396 of the Public Records of Escambia
County, Florida; and

Also less and except, that certain portion described in that certain
Special Warranty Deed dated June 12, 2000, and recorded in foicial
Record Book 4572, Pages 0706-0708 of the Public-Records of Escambia

‘County, Florida; and

Also less and except, that certain portion described in that certain

- Special Warranty Deed dated June 12, 2000, and recorded in Official

Record Book 4572 Pages 0709-0711 of the Public Records of Escambia
County, Florida; and .

Also less and except, that certain portion described in that certain
Special Warranty Deed dated June 12, 2000, and recorded in Official
Record Book 4572, Pages 0712-0714 of the Public Records of Escambia
County, Florida. .

PARCEL D

Morthwest Quarter of the Southwest Quazter.(NW% of SW%) of
Secrion 2, Township 5 North, Range 32 West.

EXHIBIT "A"



BK: 5928 PG: 546 Last Page

PARCEL E

?cgia al the Rorrieast cormer of Davis School Yard,-NQrth 46 yérds,'
szaﬁ yafffs\, South‘éi vards, East 34 yards to POR, Case 276475,
e SV, OR Y770 p 527, Ok 1798 p 66l. Section 7, Townsnip
> “orth, Range 37 West. Account number 12~2848-000.

S

EXHIBIT "A"
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STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA

CERTIFICATE OF NOTICE OF MAILING
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

CERTIFICATE # 05506 of 2005
I, ERNIE LEE MAGAHA, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT OF ESCAMBIA

COUNTY, FLORIDA, do hereby certify that I did on December 6, 2012, mail a copy of the
foregoing Notice of Application for Tax Deed, addressed to:

J BOYD SIGAFOOSE |JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE
3650 OAK SHADE RD | 3650 OAK SHADE RD
CENTURY, FL 32535 |CENTURY, FL 32535

WITNESS my official seal this 6th day of December 2012.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
SEAL s BY:
’ Maryline Avila

\ Deputy Clerk



WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
055006, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542

SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5N, RANGE 32 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
J BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013.

Dated this 6th day of December 2012,

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502, Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

-

By:

Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk



WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
05506, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542

SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5 N, RANGE 32 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
J BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013,

Dated this 6th day of December 2012.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Post Property:
5600 PINE BARREN CHURCH RD BLK By: )
Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk



WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
05506, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542

SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5 N, RANGE 32 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
JBOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013,

Dated this 6th day of December 2012,

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
Personal Services: ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
J BOYD SIGAFOOSE \
3650 OAK SHADE RD By :
CENTURY, FL 32535
Maryline Avila

Deputy Clerk



li

WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
05506, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certificate embraces the following described property in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542

SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5 N, RANGE 32 W
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069)
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of
J BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013,

Dated this 6th day of December 2012.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
Personal Services: ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE .
3650 OAK SHADE RD By:
CENTURY, FL 32535

Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk
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1010 opoe a280 4508

7012

U.S. Postal Servicew
CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)
For delivery
Postage | $ 0 - 17/,[/
Certified Fee | 2. ;’J’
(End?rg'emhﬁeggtiﬁi;%? 2.2 28 1.
Eonossvenenres | &
"

Total Postage & Fees | $ ‘5"- %’ s
Sent To ‘ T
s AL NG JBOYD jSIGAF OOSE [13-069]
or PO Box No. 3650 OAK SHADE RD
| City, State, ZIP+ CENTURY, FL 32535

PS Form 3800, ‘

|
|
- |

or on the front if spag

U.S. Postal Servicem

CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)

1
Lq-, For delivery information visit our website at www.usps.comg
o - %2
o .
ﬁ Postage | $
=0 Certified Fee
g Retum Receipt Fee
= (Endorsement Required)
3  Restricted Delivery Foe
(Endorsement Required)
o
g Total Postage & Fees $ {tﬁ/ ) j_‘_f_gi,%
3 Sent To
e JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE [13-069]
£ | or PO Box No. 3650 OAK SHADE RD
O [l Siate, ZiPed CENTURY, FL 32535

g e s

C . Dfite)of Delivery

1. Article Addressed to:

FBOYD SIGAFOOSE [13-069]
3650 OAK SHADE RD
CENTURY, FL 32535

D. Is delivery address different from item 12 [l Yes

If YES, enter delivery address below: [ No
3. ﬁvloe Type
Certified Mail [ Express Mail
[ Registered [ Return Receipt for Merchandise
O nsured Mail O C.O.D.
4. Restricted Delivery? (Extra Fes) 3 Yes

2, Article Number

(Transfer from service /qbel)

-012 1010 0002 8280 4509

roe

sENDER: COMPLETE THIS SECTION

® Complete items 1, 2| and 3. Also complete
item 4 if Restricted Delivery is desired.

B Print your name and|address on the reverse

so that we ca retui the card to you.

M Attach this card to the back of the mailpiece,
or on the front if space permits.

COMPLETE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY

A. Signature

4 ’l’ ‘ 4\‘4/

1_‘ A Z N
B. ,P ceived by ( Printed Namé)

te of Delivery

D. Is delivery address different from item 17 [ Yes

1. Article Addressad to: If YES, enter delivery address below: LI No
JUDHAHP SIGAFOOSE [13-069]
3650 OAK SHADE RD -
CENTURY, FI. 32535 3. ce Type
Certified Mail [ Express Malil :
[ Registered ] Return Receipt for Merchandise -
I Insured Mail O C.O.D.
4. Restricted Delivery? (Extra Fee) [ Yes
2. Article Number ' 7
(Transfor from servico Iabel) 7012 1010 0002 8280 451k
Domestic Return Receipt i 102595-02-M-1540

" PS Form 3811, FebruTry 2004
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ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

NON-ENFORCEABLE RETURN OF SERVICE

Document Number: ECSO12CIV056275NON Agency Number: 13-002202
Court: TAX DEED '

County: ESCAMBIA

Case Number: CERT NO 05506, 2005

Attorney/Agent:

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE COURT
TAX DEEDS

Plaintiff: RE: J BOYD SIGAFOOSE AND JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE
Defendant:

Type of Process: NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

Received this Writ on 12/4/2012 at 4:18 PM and served same at 7:30 AM on 12/11/2012 in ESCAMBIA COUNTY,
FLORIDA, by serving POST PROPERTY |, the within named, to wit; , .

POSTED TO PROPERTY AS PER CLERK'S OFFICE INSTRUCTIONS.

DAVID MORGAN, SHERIFF
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

D. PRESTON, SDS

Service Fee: $40.00
Receipt No: BILL

Printed By: PMYVARRA




WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
05506, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said cemﬁcate embraces the following described prgpbrty in the County of
Escambia, State of Florida, to wit:

CZ')

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS? TO PO;B
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542

e %}

SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5 N, RANGE 32 W

Ay

s |
-l

TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069)

e I .
g &% F -
i g §oesd

e
. . . . . T
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of — 0

JBOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013,

Dated this 6th day of December 2012,

In accordance: with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
Post Property: .
5600 PINE BARREN CHURCH RD BLK By:

Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk




-

ESCAMBIA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

NON-ENFORCEABLE RETURN OF SERVICE

Document Number: ECSO12CIV056280NON Agency Number: 13-002204
Court: TAX DEED

County: ESCAMBIA

Case Number: CERT NO 055086, 2005

Attorney/Agent:

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE COURT
TAX DEEDS

Plaintiff: RE: J BOYD SIGAFOOSE AND JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE
Defendant:

Type of Process: NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

Individual

Received this Writ on 12/4/2012 at 4:18 PM and served same on JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE , at 11:15 AM on 12/1 172012 in
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA, by delivering a true copy of this Writ together with a copy of the initial pleadings, if any,
with the date and hour of service endorsed thereon by me.

DAVID MORGAN, SHERIFF
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

DY 9% L2

-~~~ D. SWGLETON, MDS

Service Fee: $40.00
Receipt No: BILL

Printed By: PMYVARRA




WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
05506, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certlﬁcate embraces the following described property m the County of

Escambia, State of Florida, to wit: - 3’ , g
BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YDS:H‘O POI;:
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542 ~
SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5 N, RANGE 32 W é
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069) s g

-1

The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name of

JBOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013,

Dated this 6th day of December 2012.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
Personal Services: ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE . A
3650 OAK SHADE RD By:
CENTURY, FL 32535 ;
Maryline Avila

Deputy Clerk

.



ESCAMBIA COUMNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

NON-ENFORCEABLE RETURN OF SERVICE

Document Number: ECSO12CIV056277NON Agency Number: 13-002203
Court: TAXDEED

County: ESCAMBIA

Case Number: CERT NO 05506, 2005

Attorney/Agent:

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE COURT
TAX DEEDS

Plaintiff: RE: J BOYD SIGAFOOSE AND JUDITH SIGAFQOSE
Defendant:

Type of Process: NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

Substitute

Received this Writ on 12/4/2012 at 4:18 PM and served same on J BOYD SIGAFOOSE , in ESCAMBIA COUNTY,
FLORIDA, at 11:15 AM on 12/11/2012 by leaving a true copy of this Writ together with a copy of the initial pleadings, if any,
with the date and hour of service endorsed thereon by me, at the within named individual's usual place of abode, with a
person residing therein who is 15 years of age, or older, to wit: JUDITH SIGAFOOSE, WIFE, as a member of the
household and informing said person of their contents.

DAVID MORGAN, SHERIFF
ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA

[4

By: ) ) e S
D. LETON, MDS
Service Fee: $40.00
Receipt No: BILL

Printed By: PMYVARRA



. 002203

WARNING

THERE ARE UNPAID TAXES ON PROPERTY WHICH YOU OWN OR IN WHICH YOU HAVE
A LEGAL INTEREST. THE PROPERTY WILL BE SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION ON January 7,
2013, UNLESS THE TAXES ARE PAID. SHOULD YOU NEED FURTHER INFORMATION
CONTACT THE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT IMMEDIATELY AT THE COUNTY
COURTHOUSE IN PENSACOLA, FLORIDA, OR CALL 850-595-3793.

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR TAX DEED

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY holder of Tax Certificate No.
05506, issued the 1st day of June, A.D., 2005 has filed same in my office and has made application for a
tax deed to be issued thereon. Said certlﬁcate embraces the following described property in the County of

Escambia, State of Florida, to wit: 7
BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS S 45 YDS E 34 YE TO-PDB
OR 3035 P 685 OR 5928 P 542 ?_;. e
.
SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP 5 N, RANGE 32 W = »:_3
O 2
TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000 (13-069) _ 1
o N = ':J
The assessment of the said property under the said certificate issued was in the name 0f- o
i

J BOYD SIGAFOOSE and JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeemed according to law, the property described therein will be sold to the
highest bidder at the courthouse door at 9:00 A.M. on the first Monday in the month of January, which is
the 7th day of January 2013,

Dated this 6th day of December 2012.

In accordance with the AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are a person with a disability
who needs special accommodation in order to participate in this proceeding you are entitled to the provision
of certain assistance. Please contact Maryline Avila not later than seven days prior to the proceeding at
Escambia County Government Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 110, Pensacola FL 32502. Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
Personal Services: ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
J BOYD SIGAFOOSE :
3650 OAK SHADE RD By: i
CENTURY, FL 32535
Maryline Avil

Deputy Clerk



Recorded in Public Records 01/24/2013 at 09:48 AM OR Book 6364

Page 1845,
Instrument #20130052 Pam Childers Clerk of the Circuit t Escambia
County, FL Recording%jj7s.00 Deed Stamps $10.50
This instrument was prepared by: Tax Deed File No, 13-069
Pam Childers, Clerk of the Ciscuit Count 4 .
Excambia Coutty Courthouse Propertyidentification No. 075N324301000000
. Tax Account No. 122848000
Pensacoln, Florida
State of Florida
Cousnty of Escambis

The following Tax Sale Certificate Numbered 05506 jssued on Jun

e 1, 2005 was filed in the office
of the tax collegtor of this County and application mude for the issuancg of

& tax deed, the spplicant having

DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY, 5755 DAVID BLVD PORT CHARLOTTE, FL 33981, being th;
highest bidder and having paid the sum of his bid as required by the Laws of Florida,

Now, on this 7th day of January 2013, in the County of Escambia, State of Florida, in consideration
of the sum of ($1,499.86) ONE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED NINETY NINE AND 8£6/100 Doliars;
being the emount paid pursuant to the Laws of Florida does hereby sell the following fands, including any

horeditaments, buildings, fixtures and improvements of any kind snd description, situated in the County and
State aforesaid and described as follows:

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34 YDS § 45 YDS E 34 YDS TO POB
OR 3035 P 645 OR 3928 P 542

** Property previously assessed to: J BOYD SIGAFOODSE, JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

SECTION 07. TOWNSHIP § N, RANGE 32 W

’P . g,
v %um 3:3&61 fof";

LY
PAM CRILDERS, Clerk of the Circaf Count 3a7” Bl h
Escambia County, Florida i =
el ) /&
-;' ;‘ . 43 Q?
AL ; >
A 0 4
4,‘zdfefm\s§§§5g@
0gy qur ¥
witnesd / J Maryline Avila
State of Florida
County of Escambin

~
On !his%‘ﬂ!ﬂ*“ ? 20/3 before me Maryline Avila personally appeared Pam Childers, Clerk
of the Circuit Court in and fof the State and this County known 10 me 10 be the person described in, and who
executed the forogoing instrument, and acknowlzdged the execution of this instrument 10 be his own free act
and deed for the use and purposes thersin mentioned.
Witness my hand and official seal date aforesaid.

PAM CHILDERS, Clerk of the Circuit Coust
By ROl

Maryiik AV, Pepusy Clerk "

“%&'




PAM CHILDERS

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 5
CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUTT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL | CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE QOFFICIAL RECORDS
MEN‘}’ALI}S!EALTH COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
M OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
OPERATIONAL SERVICES
it CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC
PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
No Bid Tax Deed Sale Cash Summary

Cert # 005506 of 2005 Date 01/07/2013

Escambia County Government Complex « 221 Palafox Place
(850) 595-3793 « FAX (850) 595

fotat Check

Name NO BID Grand Total.

PAM CHILDERS
uit Caurt

Clerk of the Ci

Ste 110 « PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
-4827 « http://www.clerk.co.escambia, flus




PAM CHILDERS

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS ‘
CHILDSUPPORT BRANCH OFFICES
CIRCUIT CIVIL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS
CIRCUIT CRIMINAL JUVENILE DIVISION
COUNTY CIVIL CENTURY
COUNTY CRIMINAL
DOMESTIC RELATIONS
FAMILY LAW CLERK TO THE BOARD OF
JURY ASSEMBLY COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
JUVENILE OFFICIAL RECORDS
MENTAL HEALTH COUNTY OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY TREASURY
OPERATIC){?;? SERVICES OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR
PROBATE CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
TRAFFIC

PAM CHILDERS, CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
No Bid Tax Deed Sale

Cash Deposit  $0. OO
Total Check  $70.00
Cert # 005506 of 2005 Date 01/07/2013 G"a,”d Total | $7O 00

Name NO BID

........................................... o
] | S . AdvDocStamps sies
] o .
......................................................... cconir G

Cash Summary

Shenff Serv:ces over $69 o | 0

iLega! Ad over $165 0

” Total Extra TD Reglstry of Court Fees 9 B

,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,, PAM CH!LDERS
Clerk of the Circuit Court

By:
Deputy Clerk

Eseambia County Government Com plex « 221 Palafox Place Ste 110 » PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32502
(850) 595-3793 « FAX (850) 595-4827 » http://www.clerkco.escamhia.ﬂ.us




EXECUTIVE ADMINISTRATION

FINANCE
: JURY ASSEMBLY
ACCOUMTING DiviSION GUARDIANSHP
APPEALS DIMBION HUMAN RESOURCES
ARCHIVES AND RECORDS JUVENILE DIVISION
CENTURY DvisioN MARRIAGE
CLERK TO THE BOARD ; MENTAL HEALTH
COUNTY.Crvie PAM CH} LDERS MANAGEMENT INFORMATION SYSTEMS
COUNTY CRIMINAL . OFFICIAL RECORDS
Couny Division CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT AND COMPTROLLER ONE STop
CIRCUITCive, et ; OPERATIONAL SERVICES
CIRCUIT CamanaL EscamBia COuNnTy, FLORIDA PROBATE DIVISION
DOMESTIC RELATIONS TRAFFIC DWISION
Famey Law * AUITOR « ACCOUNTANT ¢ EX-DFFIIo CLERx TO THE BOARD v CUSTOUIAN OF COUkTY Funps » TREASURY

January 8, 2013

DENZEL J OR RUTH E DOCKERY
5755 DAVID BLVD
PORT CHARLOTTE, FL 33981

Dear Certificate Holder:

You are the certificate holder on a tax certificates that were presented for auction on
January 7, 2013. There were no bidders at the time of the sale. Properties that are not homestead

will be deeded to the certificate holder therefore; we need to collect recording fees and
documentary stamp taxes and filing fees:

Cert# 01594 of 2005 $72.10
Cert# 01911 of 2005 $110.10
Cert# 04813 of 2005 $65.40
Cert# 05034 of 2005 $64.70
Cert# 05314 of 2005 $82.30
Cert# 05320 of 2005 $70.70
Cert# 05506 of 2005 $70.00
Cert# 05528 of 2005 $92.60
Cert# 05539 of 2005 $83.00
Cert# 05565 of 2005 $80.80
Cert# 05673 of 2005 $72.80

Please remit the full amount of $864.50 payable to the Clerk of Court, If
questions, please call me at (850) 595-3793. Mail the check to: Clerk of the Circ
Tax deed Division, PO BOX 333 Pensacola FL 32591,

you have any
uit Court, Attn:

Sincerely,

PAM CHILDERS
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

By:

Maryline Avila
Deputy Clerk

DivisioN « PO Box 333 « PENSACOLA, FL. 32591-0333
(850) » FAX (850) e http:/iwww.escambiaclerk.com




THE ESCAMBIA SUN-PRESS, LLC

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR
. TAX DEED

NOTICE 15 HEREBY GIVEN, That
DENZEL } OR RUTH E DOCKERY
bolder of ¥ax Cestificate No. B5506,
issuexd the ist day of Jume, AD., 2005
hag Bled samie in sy office and has made
application for a tax deed to be issued
therson, Said certificate smbraces the
following described property in the
County of Bscanbin, State of Flotida, to

wit:

BEG AT NE COR OF DAVIS SCHOOL
YARD N 45 YDS W34 YRS §45 YDS
E 34 YDS TO POB OR 3035 P 685 OR
5928 P 542 SECTION 07, TOWNSHIP
SN, RANGE 32 W

TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 122848000
(13-069)

The assessment of the said property
under the said certificate issued was in
the name of } BOYD SIGAFOOSE and
JUDITH P SIGAFOOSE

Unless said certificate shall be redeamed
according t0 law, the property described
therein willbe sold to the highest bidder
at the conrtheuse door at 3:00 A M. on
the first Monday in the month of
January, which is the 7th day of January
2013, ;

Dated this 6th day of December 2612.

In accordafice with the AMERICANS
WITH DISABILITIES ACT, if you are s
person with a disability who neads spe-
cial accomnodation int ofder to pastiei-
pate in this proceeding you arc entitled
to the provision of certain assistance.
Please conthot Marvline Avils not later
than seven days prior to the proveeding
at Bscambia County Government
Complex, 221 Palafox Place Ste 116,
Pensucola FL 32502, Telephone: 850-
595-3793.

ERNIE LEE MAGAHA

CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT

ESCAMBIA COUNTY, FLORIDA
(SEAL)

By: Maryline Avila

Deputy Clerk

oaw-4w-12:6-13-26-27-2012

PUBLISHED WEEKLY SINCE 1948

(Warringten) Pensacola, Escambia County, Florida
STATE OF FLORIDA
County of Escambia

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared
Michael P. Driver

who is personally known to me and who on oath says that he is

Publisher of The Escambia Sun Press, a weekly newspaper

published at (Warrington) Pensacola in Escambia County,

Florida; that the attached copy of advertisement, being a
NOTICE in the matter of _ SALE

DATE: 01/07/2013 - TAX CERT #:05506

in the_ CIRCUIT Court
was published in said newspaper in the issues of
DECEMBER 6, 13, 20, 27, 2012

Affiant further says that the said Escambia Sun-Press is a
newspaper published at (Warrington) Pensacola, in said
Escambia County, Florida, and that the said newspaper has
heretofore been continvously published in said Escambia gounty,
Florida each week and has been entered as second class mail
matter at the post office in Pensacola, in said Escambia County,
Florida, for a period of one year next preceding the first
ublication of the attached copy of advertisement; and affiant
urther says that he has neither paid nor promised any person,
firm or corporation any discount, rebate, commission or refund

for the purpoese of securing this advertisement for publication in
the said newspaper. ‘ -~

-~

PUBLISHER

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27
day of DECEMBER AD., 20 12

[(dnvar J T

DENISE G. TURNER  NOTARY PUBLIC

Denise G. Turner
Notary Pubiic
State of Florida
My Commission Expires 08/24/2016
My Commission No.EE 207775




f . » Bankruptcy Party Search
i a3 Wed Jan 2 13:47:27 2013

Cﬁse LOCBt(}f No Baconds Found

User: ec0724 P
CHent:
Search: Bankruptcy Party Search Name SIGAFOQOSE, J BOYD Florida Northem Page: 1

No records found

PACER Service Center Receipt 01/02/2013 13:47:20 81757111
User ech724 P o :
Chient -
Description Bankapicy Party Search .
Neme SIGAFQOSE, J BOYD Floride Norther Page: 1
Pages 1($0.10}




gﬁg E S Bankruptcy Party Search
14 % . Wed Jan 2 13:47:50 2013

- Case Locator Frecont found

User; ec0724 P
GClient:
Search: Bankruptcy Party Search Name SIGAFOOSE, JUDITH P Florida Northam Page: 1

ot

1 SIGAFOOSE, JUDITH P. {idb) finbke  3:87-bk-04081 12 02/19/1987 02/08/1991
PACER Service Centar ... Receipt 010212013 13:47:52 51757273
User 00724 P SR ?
Clent

Pages 1(30.10)




Clerk of the Circuit Court of Escambia County Florida

Brnie Lee Magaha,

Receipt Type Case Outstanding Amount 0.00
Receipt Number 1419892 Receipt Date 06/05/2012
Cage Number 2005 TD 005506
Description  DOCKERY, DENZEL J OR RUTH E ve
Action TAX DEED APPLICATION
Judge
Received From DENZEBL J OR RUTH B DOCKERY
on Behalf Of DOCKERY, DENZEL J OR RUTH E
Total Received 401.00
Net Received 401.00]
; Change 0.00!
Receipt Payments Amount Reference Description
Casgh 401.00 ONCORE TRANSHI40580 '
Receipt Applications Amount
Holding 341.00
gervice Charge 60.00
Deputy Clexk: mavila Transaction Date 06/05/2012 14:38:46

Comments




AR

; 5 Print Date:
6/5/2012 2:36:47 PM
S7
Transaction #: 940580
Receipt #: 201234013
ERNIE LEE MAGAHA
Clerk of the Circuit Court Cashier Date: 6/5/2012 2:36:47 PM (MAVILA)
Escambia County, FL
P.0O. Box 333
Pensacola, FL 32591

850-595-3930

b=

Source Code: Over the
(TXD) TAX DEED DIVISION ‘Counter :
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT Q Code: Total Fees $401.00
221 PALAFOX PLACE Return Code: Government] Total Payments $401.00
Pensacola, FL 32502 Trans Type: Recording f
Agent Ref
Num:

$401.00

@ (MISCFEE) MISCELLANEOUS FEES
TAX CERT#05506 OF 2005 |
TAXCR 341 $341.00

TAXCT | 1 $60.00




"Chyis Jones
Escambia County Property App}:axser

Back
E‘] Navigate Mode & Account
¢ Reference >

"075N324301000000 Improvements: |
Accounty 122848000 Land:
Owners:  SIGAFOOSE } BOYD & JUDITH P s
Mail: 3650 OAK SHADE RD Total: $1,824

CENTURY, FL 32535 Save Our Homes: $0

. 5600 PINE BARREN CHURCH RD BLK
Situs: 37535
Disclaimer

Use Code:  VACANT RESIDENTIAL 2l ; v
Taxing Amendment 1 Calculations
Authoritys COUNTY MSTU
Tax . .
Ing i y: Q, pen Tax Inguiry Window

Sale Date Book Page Value Type ‘(’g:w e

06/2006 5928 542 $100 WD View Instr

07/1991 3035 685 $500 12} View Instr BEG AT NE COR oF DAVIS :
T T SCHOOL YARD N 46 YDS W 34

1 yDS S 45 YDS E 34 YOS TO
| roBOR 3035 P 685 .

Section Map
t{cH
07-5N-32

APPrOX.
Acreage:
0.3400

Zoned: @
MAG-2
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